Bid Name:

d

Hard and L

to Freedom Park

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

p pe Impro
Bid Number:  2016-055
Date: February 16, 2016
Dallas Digital Signs & Graphics Fort Worth Civil Constructors LLC Brownstone Companies LLC
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTYy UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Mobilization, Bonds, Insurance (Max Ls 1
1 5% of Contract) - 1,200.00 1,200.00 14,500.00 14,500.00 8,500.00 8,500.00
2 Traffic Control and Barricading L.S. 1 No Bid 3,000.00 3,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
3 Construction Staking LS. ! No Bid 3,500.00 3,500.00 3,000.00 3,000.00
2 Excavation Unclassified (+40 C.Y.) L.S. 1 No Bid 9,500.00 9,500.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
Sawcut, Remove and Dispose of Sy 23
5 Existing Concrete Sidewalk o No Bid 100.00 2,300.00 282.60 6,499.80
6 Reroute Existing 6” PVC Drain Line L.S. 1 No Bid 10,100.00 10,100.00 3,000.00 3,000.00
4" Thick 4000 psi Reinforced Concrete
Sidewalk, Complete in Place (RE: A/ S.Y. 135
7 L2.1) No Bid 119.00 16,065.00 50.93 6,875.55
4" Thick Colored Concrete, Enhanced
Paving Type A (RE: Paving Legend / S.Y. 58
8 L1.1) No Bid 265.00 15,370.00 250.00 14,500.00
4" Thick Colored Concrete, Enhanced
Paving Type B (RE: Paving Legend / S.Y. 26
9 L1.1) No Bid 315.00 8,190.00 250.00 6,500.00
World Trade Center Beam including
Transporting Beam to Site, Storing
Beam in a Secure Location,
Installation & Fabrication of Post, LS. 1
Installation of Concrete Footing, and
Installation of Beam on Posts (RE: L2.2
10 &123) No Bid 44,000.00 44,000.00 18,000.00 18,000.00
Concrete Curb around World Trade
Center Beam (RE: A& B/L2.2&A/ L.F. 42
11 L2.3) No Bid 130.00 5,460.00 19.05 800.10
Tejas Black' Crushed Stone under
World Trade Center Beam including c.y. 1
12 filter fabric (RE: A /12.2) No Bid 1,100.00 1,100.00 1,000.00 1,000.00
Time Line Graphic Panel, including
shipping and installation (RE: A/ L2.3 Each 2
13 & L2.4) 1,945.00 3,890.00 10,000.00 20,000.00 5,000.00 10,000.00
14 Flagpole Sleeves (RE: B /12.1) Each 3 No Bid 850.00 2,550.00 1,333.33 3,999.99
Monument Sign, including metal
letters, decorative panel & frame,
concrete pedestal with vertical LS 1
reveals, footing, pier, drainage, and
15 gravel (RE: L2.7) 7,675.00 7,675.00 15,000.00 15,000.00 10,500.00 10,500.00
GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Hardscape and Landscape Improvements to Freedom Park
Bid Number:  2016-055
Date: February 16, 2016
Dallas Digital Signs & Graphics Fort Worth Civil Constructors LLC Brownstone Companies LLC
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTyYy UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
Donor Sign, including metal letters,
metal bar, donor recognition plaques,
. LS 1
decorative panel & frame, concrete
16 pedestal, footing, pier, drainage, and 6,675.00 6,675.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 10,500.00 10,500.00
Memorial Signage Pin-Mounted
Letters and Bar @ Entry into 9/11 Each 2
17 Plaza (RE: D/ L2.5) 1,500.00 3,000.00 5,000.00 10,000.00 2,500.00 5,000.00
Memorial Plaque @ Entry into 9/11 Pl Each 2
18 1,525.00 3,050.00 1,500.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 6,000.00
Concrete Seat Wall, 2'-0" Ht., LF 6
19 including footing (RE: D / L2.5) T No Bid 300.00 1,800.00 916.66 5,499.96
Concrete Seat Wall, 1'-6" Ht, including LE 123
20 vertical reveal & footing (RE: A /12.5) No Bid 225.00 27,675.00 125.00 15,375.00
General Electrical Service (RE: L1.3) LS. 1 .
21 No Bid 5,000.00 5,000.00 6,500.00 6,500.00
Lighted Bollard (RE: Lighting Legend / Each 6
22 No Bid 1,500.00 9,000.00 2,100.00 12,600.00
Monument Sign Uplight (RE: Lighting L Each 2 .
23 No Bid 2,600.00 5,200.00 1,500.00 3,000.00
World Trade Center Beam Uplight (RE:| Each 2
24 No Bid 3,000.00 6,000.00 1,500.00 3,000.00
Purple Wintercreeper / 1 gallon (RE: Pl Each 493 .
25 No Bid 24.00 11,832.00 12.00 5,916.00
Bed Preparation & Topmulch S.F. 1,100
26 No Bid 3.00 3,300.00 254.54 279,994.00
Steel Edging (RE: (D & E/ L3.1) L.F. 90 .
27 No Bid 5.00 450.00 4.16 374.40
Solid Sod Bermudagrass on All Disturb S.Y. 278
28 No Bid 6.00 1,668.00 10.07 2,799.46
Install New & Repair Irrigation System L.S. 1 .
29 No Bid 13,000.00 13,000.00 4,800.00 4,800.00
Tree protection, including providing,
installing, and maintaining, (RE: B / Each 7
30 13.1) No Bid 600.00 4,200.00 4,800.00
Interim Maintenance (Landscape) LS 1
31 No Bid 2,900.00 2,900.00 3,500.00 3,500.00
REJECTED REJECTED REJECTED
GROSS TOTAL: $ 25,490.00 $ 300,660.00 468,834.26
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $ 25,490.00 $ 300,660.00 468,834.26
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY: 60 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days
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