
City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group 1 - Gloves

2016-003--01-01 Side Leather Palm Gloves 600 pair 2.05 1,230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.46 876.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-02 Vinyl Coated Gloves 600 pair 1.20 720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--01-03 Large Heavy Weight Cotton/Polly Glove Liner 8400 pair 0.25 2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--01-04 Double Palm Work Glove 360 pair 2.50 900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.61 579.60 No Bid

2016-003--01-05 Heavy Duty Side Split Work Glove 120 pair 6.95 834.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--01-06 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 300 pair 0.80 240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.63 189.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-07 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 3000 pair 0.40 1,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.38 1,140.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-08 Black PVC Gloves 60 pair 1.65 99.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.45 87.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-09 Large PVC Gloves 200 pair 2.10 420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.10 420.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-10 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 120 pair 3.40 408.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.17 380.40 No Bid

2016-003--01-11 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 400 pair 3.40 1,360.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.17 1,268.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-12 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 1000 pair 3.40 3,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.17 3,170.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-13 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 900 pair 3.50 3,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.17 2,853.00 No Bid

2016-003--01-14 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 200 pair 3.80 760.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--01-15 Medium Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box 5.65 1,695.00 3.50 1,050.00 8.20 2,460.00 9.00 2,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--01-16 Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box 5.65 1,695.00 3.50 1,050.00 8.20 2,460.00 9.00 2,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--01-17 Extra Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 360 box 5.65 2,034.00 3.50 1,260.00 8.20 2,952.00 9.00 3,240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Group 1 $22,245.00 $3,360.00 $7,872.00 $8,640.00 No Bid $10,963.00 No Bid

Group 2 - Boots and Liners

2016-003--02-01 PVC Boots 3 pair 12.65 37.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-02 PVC Boots 6 pair 12.65 75.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-03 PVC Boots 16 pair 12.65 202.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-04 PVC Boots 20 pair 12.65 253.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-05 PVC Boots 60 pair 12.65 759.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-06 PVC Boots 70 pair 12.65 885.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-07 PVC Boots 50 pair 12.65 632.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-08 PVC Boots 20 pair 12.65 253.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-09 PVC Boots 10 pair 12.65 126.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-10 PVC Boots 6 pair 12.65 75.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-11 PVC Boots 3 pair 12.65 37.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-12 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair 41.50 249.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-13 Hip Wader Boots 15 pair 41.50 622.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-14 Hip Wader Boots 30 pair 41.50 1,245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-15 Hip Wader Boots 20 pair 41.50 830.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-16 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair 41.50 664.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-17 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair 41.50 664.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-18 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair 41.50 249.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-19 Hip Wader Boots 3 pair 41.50 124.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-20 Medium Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair 8.95 268.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-21 Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair 8.95 268.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--02-22 Extra Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair 8.95 268.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Group 2 $8,793.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Centerline Supply

Security Safety & 

Supply

Interboro Packaging 

Corporation

PH&S Products, 

LLC

PH&S Products, 

LLC (alternate)

Pathmark Traffic 

Products of Texas

Major Gloves & 

Safety, Inc.
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group 3 - Rain Gear

2016-003--03-01 Trench Coats - Size Small 4 each 5.15 20.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-02 Trench Coats - Size Medium 12 each 5.15 61.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-03 Trench Coats - Size Large 100 each 5.15 515.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-04 Trench Coats - Size X-Large 100 each 5.15 515.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-05 Trench Coats - Size 2X-Large 100 each 5.15 515.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-06 Trench Coats - Size 3X-Large 100 each 5.15 515.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-07 Trench Coats - Size 4X-Large 30 each 5.15 154.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-08 Trench Coats - Size 5X-Large 20 each 5.15 103.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--03-09 Rain Suits - Size Small 4 each 6.50 26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.50 22.00 No Bid

2016-003--03-10 Rain Suits - Size Medium 12 each 6.50 78.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.50 66.00 No Bid

2016-003--03-11 Rain Suits - Size Large 200 each 6.50 1,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.50 1,100.00 No Bid

2016-003--03-12 Rain Suits - Size X-Large 100 each 6.50 650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.65 565.00 No Bid

2016-003--03-13 Rain Suits - Size 2X-Large 80 each 6.50 520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.50 440.00 No Bid

2016-003--03-14 Rain Suits - Size 3X-Large 80 each 6.50 520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.50 440.00 No Bid

2016-003--03-15 Rain Suits - Size 4X-Large 20 each 6.90 138.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.80 116.00 No Bid

2016-003--03-16 Rain Suits - Size 5X-Large 10 each 6.90 69.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.80 58.00 No Bid

Total Group 3 $5,700.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,807.00 No Bid

Group 4 - First Aid & Personal Safety Items

2016-003--04-01 First Aid Kit 50 each 18.20 910.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-02 TECNU Poison Oak & Ivy Cleaner 4 oz. 25 each 4.30 107.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-03 TECNU Extreme Cleanser 4 oz. Tube 50 each 9.85 492.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-04 Ivy Block - pre contact lotion 4 oz. 60 each 3.90 234.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-05 Sun-X SPF30 Sunscreen 4 oz. 300 each 5.20 1,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-06 Leather Kneepads 10 pair 11.60 116.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-07 Regular Brim Safety Hat 60 each 4.95 297.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-08 Plastic Capped Knee Pads 40 pair 9.25 370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-09 Ear Plugs 15 box 57.95 869.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-10 Foam Corded Ear Plugs 32 box 14.75 472.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-11 Clear Safety Glasses 200 each 1.25 250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.85 170.00 No Bid

2016-003--04-12 Half Facepiece Respirator 12 each 9.35 112.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-13 Ear Muff Hearing Protector 40 each 5.15 206.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-14 Organic Vapor / Acid Gas Cartridge 12 pair 17.95 215.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-15 Tinted Safety Glasses 1000 each 1.35 1,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.85 850.00 No Bid

2016-003--04-16 Full Brim Safety Hat 36 each 6.95 250.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--04-17 Respirator Dust Mask 50 box 7.50 375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.87 343.50 No Bid

2016-003--04-18 Gatorade Sport Drink 1800 each 4.95 8,910.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Group 4 $17,097.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,363.50 No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Security Safety & 

Supply

Interboro Packaging 

Corporation

PH&S Products, 

LLC

PH&S Products, 

LLC (alternate)

Pathmark Traffic 

Products of Texas

Major Gloves & 

Safety, Inc. Centerline Supply
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

Group 5 - Cones, Safety Vest, Flags/Flagging

2016-003--05-01 Safety Vest - Size Large 200 each 4.95 990.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.18 2,036.00

2016-003--05-02 Safety Vest - Size X-Large 200 each 4.95 990.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.38 2,076.00

2016-003--05-03 Safety Vest - Size 2X-Large 100 each 4.95 495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.75 1,075.00

2016-003--05-04 Safety Vest - Size 3X-Large 50 each 4.95 247.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.04 552.00

2016-003--05-05 Safety Vest - Size 4X-Large 25 each 4.95 123.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.68 292.00

2016-003--05-06 Safety Vest - Size 5X-Large 25 each 4.95 123.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.41 310.25

2016-003--05-07 Warning Flags 30 each 1.55 46.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.95 148.50 No Bid 2.90 87.00

2016-003--05-08 Orange Traffic Cones 400 each 16.25 6,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.99 5,196.00 No Bid 13.48 5,392.00

2016-003--05-09 Green Safety Cones 200 each 18.50 3,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.99 2,798.00 No Bid 18.42 3,684.00

2016-003--05-10 Fluorescent Orange Flagging 400 each 1.30 520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2016-003--05-11 Yellow Caution Tape 50 each 5.25 262.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.99 699.50 2.98 149.00 No Bid

2016-003--05-12 Safety Grid Fence 12 each 19.95 239.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 65.00 780.00 No Bid 66.92 803.04

Total Group 5 $14,238.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,622.00 $149.00 $16,307.29

Minimum dollar amount per order $0.00 $500.00 $0.00 $2,000.00 $500.00

Signature Page Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

GROSS TOTAL: $68,074.45 $3,360.00 $7,872.00 $8,640.00 $9,622.00 $15,282.50 $16,307.29

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL: 68,074.45$  3,360.00$  7,872.00$  8,640.00$  9,622.00$  15,282.50$  16,307.29$  

TERMS:

DELIVERY: 2-3 Calendar Days 10-14 Calendar Days 2 Calendar Days 2 Calendar Days 14 Calendar Days 7-10 Calendar Days 5-10 Calendar Days

Net 30 Net 30

$82.00 or $90.00 

depending on 

selection of glove 

offered.

$82.00 or $90.00 

depending on 

selection of glove 

offered.

Awarded Bid

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Centerline Supply

Security Safety & 

Supply

Interboro Packaging 

Corporation

P H & S 

Products, LLC

P H & S 

Products, LLC 

(alternate)

Pathmark Traffic 

Products of Texas

Major Gloves & 

Safety, Inc.
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 1 - Gloves

2016-003--01-01 Side Leather Palm Gloves 600 pair

2016-003--01-02 Vinyl Coated Gloves 600 pair

2016-003--01-03 Large Heavy Weight Cotton/Polly Glove Liner 8400 pair

2016-003--01-04 Double Palm Work Glove 360 pair

2016-003--01-05 Heavy Duty Side Split Work Glove 120 pair

2016-003--01-06 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 300 pair

2016-003--01-07 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 3000 pair

2016-003--01-08 Black PVC Gloves 60 pair

2016-003--01-09 Large PVC Gloves 200 pair

2016-003--01-10 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 120 pair

2016-003--01-11 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 400 pair

2016-003--01-12 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 1000 pair

2016-003--01-13 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 900 pair

2016-003--01-14 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 200 pair

2016-003--01-15 Medium Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box

2016-003--01-16 Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box

2016-003--01-17 Extra Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 360 box

Total Group 1

Group 2 - Boots and Liners

2016-003--02-01 PVC Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-02 PVC Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-03 PVC Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-04 PVC Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-05 PVC Boots 60 pair

2016-003--02-06 PVC Boots 70 pair

2016-003--02-07 PVC Boots 50 pair

2016-003--02-08 PVC Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-09 PVC Boots 10 pair

2016-003--02-10 PVC Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-11 PVC Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-12 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-13 Hip Wader Boots 15 pair

2016-003--02-14 Hip Wader Boots 30 pair

2016-003--02-15 Hip Wader Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-16 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-17 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-18 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-19 Hip Wader Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-20 Medium Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

2016-003--02-21 Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

2016-003--02-22 Extra Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

Total Group 2

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

1.46 876.00 No Bid No Bid 1.52 912.00 1.92 1,152.00 1.95 1,170.00

1.06 636.00 No Bid No Bid 0.98 588.00 0.97 582.00 1.56 936.00

0.20 1,680.00 No Bid No Bid 0.30 2,520.00 0.40 3,360.00 0.25 2,100.00

1.68 604.80 No Bid No Bid 2.07 745.20 2.67 961.20 1.91 687.60

5.20 624.00 No Bid No Bid 2.23 267.60 2.55 306.00 4.69 562.80

0.77 231.00 No Bid 0.65 195.00 0.82 246.00 0.44 132.00 0.13 39.00

0.40 1,200.00 No Bid 0.65 1,950.00 0.45 1,350.00 0.44 1,320.00 0.13 390.00

1.63 97.80 1.85 111.00 No Bid 1.75 105.00 1.95 117.00 1.86 111.60

2.08 416.00 0.99 198.00 No Bid 2.51 502.00 3.00 600.00 3.41 682.00

2.67 320.40 8.75 1,050.00 5.80 696.00 3.41 409.20 5.10 612.00 5.00 600.00

2.67 1,068.00 8.75 3,500.00 5.80 2,320.00 3.41 1,364.00 5.10 2,040.00 5.00 2,000.00

2.67 2,670.00 8.75 8,750.00 5.80 5,800.00 3.41 3,410.00 5.10 5,100.00 5.00 5,000.00

2.77 2,493.00 8.75 7,875.00 5.80 5,220.00 3.51 3,159.00 5.10 4,590.00 5.21 4,689.00

3.32 664.00 8.75 1,750.00 5.80 1,160.00 3.62 724.00 5.62 1,124.00 5.63 1,126.00

5.40 1,620.00 4.00 1,200.00 No Bid 3.98 1,194.00 6.25 1,875.00 6.94 2,082.00

5.40 1,620.00 4.00 1,200.00 No Bid 3.98 1,194.00 6.25 1,875.00 6.94 2,082.00

5.40 1,944.00 4.00 1,440.00 No Bid 3.98 1,432.80 6.25 2,250.00 6.94 2,498.40

$18,765.00 $27,074.00 $17,341.00 $20,122.80 $27,996.20 $26,756.40

No Bid No Bid 11.50 34.50 12.59 37.77 11.95 35.85 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 11.50 69.00 12.59 75.54 11.95 71.70 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 255.84 11.50 184.00 12.59 201.44 11.95 191.20 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 319.8 11.50 230.00 12.59 251.80 11.95 239.00 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 959.4 11.50 690.00 12.59 755.40 11.95 717.00 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 1119.3 11.50 805.00 12.59 881.30 11.95 836.50 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 799.5 11.50 575.00 12.59 629.50 11.95 597.50 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 319.8 11.50 230.00 12.59 251.80 11.95 239.00 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 159.9 11.50 115.00 12.59 125.90 11.95 119.50 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 95.94 11.50 69.00 12.59 75.54 11.95 71.70 No Bid

No Bid 15.99 47.97 11.50 34.50 12.59 37.77 17.01 51.03 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 243.00 No Bid 66.05 396.30 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 607.50 No Bid 66.05 990.75 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 1,215.00 No Bid 66.05 1,981.50 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 810.00 No Bid 66.05 1,321.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 648.00 No Bid 66.05 1,056.80 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 648.00 No Bid 66.05 1,056.80 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 243.00 No Bid 66.05 396.30 No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.50 121.50 No Bid 66.05 198.15 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.10 483.00 17.99 539.70

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.10 483.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.10 483.00 No Bid

No Bid $4,077.45 $7,572.00 $3,323.76 $12,016.58 $539.70

Eagle Barricade, LLC

SunWest Sales 

Company

Agni Enterprises, 

LLC (DBA) Head to 

Heels Safety 

Supplies

Viewbrite Safety 

Products

Pyramid School 

Products

Magid Glove & 

Safety Mfg. Co., 

LLC (alternate)
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 3 - Rain Gear

2016-003--03-01 Trench Coats - Size Small 4 each

2016-003--03-02 Trench Coats - Size Medium 12 each

2016-003--03-03 Trench Coats - Size Large 100 each

2016-003--03-04 Trench Coats - Size X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-05 Trench Coats - Size 2X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-06 Trench Coats - Size 3X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-07 Trench Coats - Size 4X-Large 30 each

2016-003--03-08 Trench Coats - Size 5X-Large 20 each

2016-003--03-09 Rain Suits - Size Small 4 each

2016-003--03-10 Rain Suits - Size Medium 12 each

2016-003--03-11 Rain Suits - Size Large 200 each

2016-003--03-12 Rain Suits - Size X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-13 Rain Suits - Size 2X-Large 80 each

2016-003--03-14 Rain Suits - Size 3X-Large 80 each

2016-003--03-15 Rain Suits - Size 4X-Large 20 each

2016-003--03-16 Rain Suits - Size 5X-Large 10 each

Total Group 3

Group 4 - First Aid & Personal Safety Items

2016-003--04-01 First Aid Kit 50 each

2016-003--04-02 TECNU Poison Oak & Ivy Cleaner 4 oz. 25 each

2016-003--04-03 TECNU Extreme Cleanser 4 oz. Tube 50 each

2016-003--04-04 Ivy Block - pre contact lotion 4 oz. 60 each

2016-003--04-05 Sun-X SPF30 Sunscreen 4 oz. 300 each

2016-003--04-06 Leather Kneepads 10 pair

2016-003--04-07 Regular Brim Safety Hat 60 each

2016-003--04-08 Plastic Capped Knee Pads 40 pair

2016-003--04-09 Ear Plugs 15 box

2016-003--04-10 Foam Corded Ear Plugs 32 box

2016-003--04-11 Clear Safety Glasses 200 each

2016-003--04-12 Half Facepiece Respirator 12 each

2016-003--04-13 Ear Muff Hearing Protector 40 each

2016-003--04-14 Organic Vapor / Acid Gas Cartridge 12 pair

2016-003--04-15 Tinted Safety Glasses 1000 each

2016-003--04-16 Full Brim Safety Hat 36 each

2016-003--04-17 Respirator Dust Mask 50 box

2016-003--04-18 Gatorade Sport Drink 1800 each

Total Group 4

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

4.26 17.04 No Bid 7.00 28.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 30.92

4.26 51.12 No Bid 7.00 84.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 92.76

4.26 426.00 No Bid 7.00 700.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 773.00

4.26 426.00 No Bid 7.00 700.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 773.00

4.26 426.00 No Bid 7.00 700.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 773.00

4.65 465.00 No Bid 7.00 700.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 773.00

4.65 139.50 No Bid 7.00 210.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 231.90

4.65 93.00 No Bid 7.00 140.00 No Bid No Bid 7.73 154.60

5.59 22.36 8.13 32.52 11.50 46.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 42.00

5.59 67.08 8.13 97.56 11.50 138.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 126.00

5.59 1,118.00 8.13 1,626.00 11.50 2,300.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 2,100.00

5.59 559.00 8.13 813.00 11.50 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 1,050.00

5.59 447.20 8.13 650.40 11.50 920.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 840.00

5.59 447.20 8.13 650.40 11.50 920.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 840.00

5.89 117.80 8.13 162.60 11.50 230.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 210.00

5.89 58.90 8.13 81.30 11.50 115.00 No Bid No Bid 10.50 105.00

$4,881.20 $4,113.78 $9,081.00 No Bid No Bid $8,915.18

No Bid 18.00 900.00 No Bid 12.99 649.50 11.65 582.50 36.61 1,830.50

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.15 103.75 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.35 1,761.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.55 1,065.00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.80 218.00 No Bid

No Bid 6.00 360.00 No Bid 5.99 359.40 5.20 312.00 7.44 446.40

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.70 708.00 No Bid

No Bid 21.09 316.35 No Bid No Bid 85.25 1,278.75 76.12 1,141.80

No Bid 21.09 674.88 No Bid 13.99 447.68 12.80 409.60 24.88 796.16

No Bid 0.88 176.00 1.90 380.00 No Bid 3.80 760.00 2.63 526.00

No Bid 21.50 258.00 No Bid No Bid 23.80 285.60 30.00 360.00

No Bid 7.50 300.00 No Bid No Bid 13.25 530.00 8.13 325.20

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.55 234.60 No Bid

No Bid 0.88 880.00 1.90 1,900.00 1.59 1,590.00 3.80 3,800.00 2.96 2,960.00

No Bid 6.00 216.00 No Bid 8.98 323.28 15.25 549.00 6.76 243.36

No Bid 5.60 280.00 No Bid 6.99 349.50 8.50 425.00 12.00 600.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.69 6,642.00 3.87 6,966.00 3.54 6,372.00

No Bid $4,361.23 $2,280.00 $10,361.36 $19,988.80 $15,601.42

Viewbrite Safety 

Products

Pyramid School 

Products

Magid Glove & 

Safety Mfg. Co., 

LLC (alternate) Eagle Barricade, LLC

SunWest Sales 

Company

Agni Enterprises, 

LLC (DBA) Head to 

Heels Safety 

Supplies
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 5 - Cones, Safety Vest, Flags/Flagging

2016-003--05-01 Safety Vest - Size Large 200 each

2016-003--05-02 Safety Vest - Size X-Large 200 each

2016-003--05-03 Safety Vest - Size 2X-Large 100 each

2016-003--05-04 Safety Vest - Size 3X-Large 50 each

2016-003--05-05 Safety Vest - Size 4X-Large 25 each

2016-003--05-06 Safety Vest - Size 5X-Large 25 each

2016-003--05-07 Warning Flags 30 each

2016-003--05-08 Orange Traffic Cones 400 each

2016-003--05-09 Green Safety Cones 200 each

2016-003--05-10 Fluorescent Orange Flagging 400 each

2016-003--05-11 Yellow Caution Tape 50 each

2016-003--05-12 Safety Grid Fence 12 each

Total Group 5

Minimum dollar amount per order

Signature Page

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

4.90 980.00 No Bid 7.00 1,400.00 No Bid No Bid 6.25 1,250.00

4.90 980.00 No Bid 7.00 1,400.00 No Bid No Bid 6.25 1,250.00

4.90 490.00 No Bid 7.00 700.00 3.99 399.00 No Bid 6.25 625.00

4.90 245.00 No Bid 7.00 350.00 3.99 199.50 No Bid 6.25 312.50

4.90 122.50 No Bid 7.00 175.00 3.99 99.75 No Bid 6.25 156.25

4.90 122.50 No Bid 7.00 175.00 3.99 99.75 No Bid 6.25 156.25

1.53 45.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.12 123.60

12.82 5,128.00 No Bid No Bid 15.98 6,392.00 No Bid 14.38 5,752.00

14.80 2,960.00 No Bid No Bid 16.99 3,398.00 No Bid 15.62 3,124.00

1.29 516.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.20 210.00 No Bid 5.66 283.00 6.99 349.50 No Bid 11.56 578.00

19.75 237.00 No Bid No Bid 18.99 227.88 No Bid No Bid

$12,036.90 No Bid $4,483.00 $11,165.38 No Bid $13,327.60

$100.00 $500.00 $0.00 $50.00 $100.00

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

$35,683.10 $39,626.46 $40,757.00 $44,973.30 $60,001.58 $65,140.30

(396.26)

35,683.10$  39,230.20$  40,757.00$  44,973.30$  60,001.58$  65,140.30$  

5-7 Calendar Days Not Stated 10-14 Calendar Days 10 Calendar Days 20 Calendar Days30 Calendar Days

Net 30 Net 30Net 30 1% 5 Calendar Days Net 30 Net 30

$50.00, in full cases 

only

Eagle Barricade, LLC

SunWest Sales 

Company

Agni Enterprises, 

LLC (DBA) Head to 

Heels Safety 

Supplies

Viewbrite Safety 

Products

Pyramid School 

Products

Magid Glove & 

Safety Mfg. Co., 

LLC (alternate)
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 1 - Gloves

2016-003--01-01 Side Leather Palm Gloves 600 pair

2016-003--01-02 Vinyl Coated Gloves 600 pair

2016-003--01-03 Large Heavy Weight Cotton/Polly Glove Liner 8400 pair

2016-003--01-04 Double Palm Work Glove 360 pair

2016-003--01-05 Heavy Duty Side Split Work Glove 120 pair

2016-003--01-06 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 300 pair

2016-003--01-07 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 3000 pair

2016-003--01-08 Black PVC Gloves 60 pair

2016-003--01-09 Large PVC Gloves 200 pair

2016-003--01-10 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 120 pair

2016-003--01-11 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 400 pair

2016-003--01-12 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 1000 pair

2016-003--01-13 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 900 pair

2016-003--01-14 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 200 pair

2016-003--01-15 Medium Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box

2016-003--01-16 Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box

2016-003--01-17 Extra Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 360 box

Total Group 1

Group 2 - Boots and Liners

2016-003--02-01 PVC Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-02 PVC Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-03 PVC Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-04 PVC Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-05 PVC Boots 60 pair

2016-003--02-06 PVC Boots 70 pair

2016-003--02-07 PVC Boots 50 pair

2016-003--02-08 PVC Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-09 PVC Boots 10 pair

2016-003--02-10 PVC Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-11 PVC Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-12 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-13 Hip Wader Boots 15 pair

2016-003--02-14 Hip Wader Boots 30 pair

2016-003--02-15 Hip Wader Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-16 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-17 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-18 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-19 Hip Wader Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-20 Medium Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

2016-003--02-21 Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

2016-003--02-22 Extra Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

Total Group 2

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

1.92 1,152.00 1.81 1,086.00 2.35 1,410.00 2.35 1,410.00 2.30 1,380.00 2.31 1,386.00

0.97 582.00 1.32 792.00 1.41 846.00 1.75 1,050.00 1.99 1,194.00 1.39 834.00

0.40 3,360.00 0.44 3,696.00 0.33 2,772.00 0.55 4,620.00 0.28 2,352.00 0.32 2,688.00

2.67 961.20 1.94 698.40 3.23 1,162.80 3.20 1,152.00 2.59 932.40 3.18 1,144.80

2.55 306.00 8.78 1,053.60 8.56 1,027.20 8.50 1,020.00 3.25 390.00 8.44 1,012.80

0.44 132.00 0.83 249.00 0.48 144.00 0.70 210.00 0.78 234.00 0.44 132.00

0.44 1,320.00 0.42 1,260.00 0.48 1,440.00 0.60 1,800.00 0.78 2,340.00 0.44 1,320.00

1.95 117.00 1.89 113.40 1.99 119.40 2.10 126.00 2.00 120.00 1.95 117.00

3.00 600.00 2.93 586.00 3.94 788.00 3.50 700.00 3.20 640.00 3.87 774.00

7.04 844.80 5.04 604.80 6.33 759.60 5.05 606.00 5.00 600.00 4.17 500.40

7.04 2,816.00 5.42 2,168.00 6.33 2,532.00 5.05 2,020.00 5.00 2,000.00 4.17 1,668.00

7.04 7,040.00 5.42 5,420.00 6.33 6,330.00 5.05 5,050.00 5.00 5,000.00 4.17 4,170.00

7.19 6,471.00 5.53 4,977.00 6.46 5,814.00 5.15 4,635.00 5.00 4,500.00 4.17 3,753.00

7.19 1,438.00 5.59 1,118.00 6.70 1,340.00 5.35 1,070.00 5.25 1,050.00 4.51 902.00

10.90 3,270.00 7.89 2,367.00 No Bid 5.50 1,650.00 7.20 2,160.00 10.06 3,018.00

10.90 3,270.00 7.89 2,367.00 No Bid 5.50 1,650.00 7.20 2,160.00 10.06 3,018.00

10.90 3,924.00 7.89 2,840.40 No Bid 5.50 1,980.00 7.20 2,592.00 10.06 3,621.60

$37,604.00 $31,396.60 $26,485.00 $30,749.00 $29,644.40 $30,059.60

11.95 35.85 11.85 35.55 15.64 46.92 15.85 47.55 14.25 42.75 14.90 44.70

11.95 71.70 11.85 71.10 15.64 93.84 15.85 95.10 14.25 85.50 14.90 89.40

11.95 191.20 11.85 189.60 15.64 250.24 15.85 253.60 14.25 228.00 14.90 238.40

11.95 239.00 11.85 237.00 15.64 312.80 15.85 317.00 14.25 285.00 14.90 298.00

11.95 717.00 11.85 711.00 15.64 938.40 15.85 951.00 14.25 855.00 14.90 894.00

11.95 836.50 11.85 829.50 15.64 1,094.80 15.85 1,109.50 14.25 997.50 14.90 1,043.00

11.95 597.50 11.85 592.50 15.64 782.00 15.85 792.50 14.25 712.50 14.90 745.00

11.95 239.00 11.85 237.00 15.64 312.80 15.85 317.00 14.25 285.00 14.90 298.00

11.95 119.50 11.85 118.50 15.64 156.40 15.85 158.50 14.25 142.50 14.90 149.00

11.95 71.70 11.85 71.10 15.64 93.84 No Bid 14.25 85.50 14.90 89.40

17.01 51.03 No Bid 15.64 46.92 No Bid 15.00 45.00 14.90 44.70

66.05 396.30 51.10 306.60 64.49 386.94 61.00 366.00 70.00 420.00 61.55 369.30

66.05 990.75 51.10 766.50 64.49 967.35 61.00 915.00 70.00 1,050.00 61.55 923.25

66.05 1,981.50 51.10 1,533.00 64.49 1,934.70 61.00 1,830.00 70.00 2,100.00 61.55 1,846.50

66.05 1,321.00 51.10 1,022.00 64.49 1,289.80 61.00 1,220.00 70.00 1,400.00 61.55 1,231.00

66.05 1,056.80 51.10 817.60 64.49 1,031.84 61.00 976.00 70.00 1,120.00 61.55 984.80

66.05 1,056.80 51.10 817.60 64.49 1,031.84 61.00 976.00 70.00 1,120.00 61.55 984.80

66.05 396.30 51.10 306.60 64.49 386.94 61.00 366.00 70.00 420.00 61.55 369.30

66.05 198.15 51.10 153.30 64.49 193.47 No Bid 70.00 210.00 61.55 184.65

16.10 483.00 14.98 449.40 14.93 447.90 No Bid 15.50 465.00 14.97 449.10

16.10 483.00 14.98 449.40 14.93 447.90 No Bid 15.50 465.00 14.97 449.10

16.10 483.00 14.98 449.40 14.93 447.90 No Bid 15.50 465.00 14.97 449.10

$12,016.58 $10,164.25 $12,695.54 $10,690.75 $12,999.25 $12,174.50

Northern Safety Co., 

Inc.

Magid Glove & 

Safety Mfg. Co., 

LLC

Lone Star Safety & 

Supply

All Safe Industries, 

Inc. Safety Supply, Inc. Texas Safety Supply
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 3 - Rain Gear

2016-003--03-01 Trench Coats - Size Small 4 each

2016-003--03-02 Trench Coats - Size Medium 12 each

2016-003--03-03 Trench Coats - Size Large 100 each

2016-003--03-04 Trench Coats - Size X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-05 Trench Coats - Size 2X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-06 Trench Coats - Size 3X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-07 Trench Coats - Size 4X-Large 30 each

2016-003--03-08 Trench Coats - Size 5X-Large 20 each

2016-003--03-09 Rain Suits - Size Small 4 each

2016-003--03-10 Rain Suits - Size Medium 12 each

2016-003--03-11 Rain Suits - Size Large 200 each

2016-003--03-12 Rain Suits - Size X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-13 Rain Suits - Size 2X-Large 80 each

2016-003--03-14 Rain Suits - Size 3X-Large 80 each

2016-003--03-15 Rain Suits - Size 4X-Large 20 each

2016-003--03-16 Rain Suits - Size 5X-Large 10 each

Total Group 3

Group 4 - First Aid & Personal Safety Items

2016-003--04-01 First Aid Kit 50 each

2016-003--04-02 TECNU Poison Oak & Ivy Cleaner 4 oz. 25 each

2016-003--04-03 TECNU Extreme Cleanser 4 oz. Tube 50 each

2016-003--04-04 Ivy Block - pre contact lotion 4 oz. 60 each

2016-003--04-05 Sun-X SPF30 Sunscreen 4 oz. 300 each

2016-003--04-06 Leather Kneepads 10 pair

2016-003--04-07 Regular Brim Safety Hat 60 each

2016-003--04-08 Plastic Capped Knee Pads 40 pair

2016-003--04-09 Ear Plugs 15 box

2016-003--04-10 Foam Corded Ear Plugs 32 box

2016-003--04-11 Clear Safety Glasses 200 each

2016-003--04-12 Half Facepiece Respirator 12 each

2016-003--04-13 Ear Muff Hearing Protector 40 each

2016-003--04-14 Organic Vapor / Acid Gas Cartridge 12 pair

2016-003--04-15 Tinted Safety Glasses 1000 each

2016-003--04-16 Full Brim Safety Hat 36 each

2016-003--04-17 Respirator Dust Mask 50 box

2016-003--04-18 Gatorade Sport Drink 1800 each

Total Group 4

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

No Bid 5.88 23.52 6.25 25.00 6.50 26.00 8.50 34.00 6.30 25.20

No Bid 5.88 70.56 6.25 75.00 6.50 78.00 8.50 102.00 6.30 75.60

No Bid 5.88 588.00 6.25 625.00 6.50 650.00 8.50 850.00 6.30 630.00

No Bid 5.88 588.00 6.25 625.00 6.50 650.00 8.50 850.00 6.30 630.00

No Bid 5.88 588.00 6.25 625.00 6.50 650.00 8.50 850.00 6.30 630.00

No Bid 6.31 631.00 6.70 670.00 7.00 700.00 8.50 850.00 6.75 675.00

No Bid 6.62 198.60 7.03 210.90 7.50 225.00 8.50 255.00 7.09 212.70

No Bid 6.91 138.20 7.34 146.80 8.00 160.00 8.50 170.00 7.40 148.00

No Bid 6.83 27.32 7.25 29.00 7.00 28.00 10.00 40.00 7.77 31.08

No Bid 6.83 81.96 7.25 87.00 7.00 84.00 10.00 120.00 7.77 93.24

No Bid 6.83 1,366.00 7.25 1,450.00 7.00 1,400.00 10.00 2,000.00 7.77 1,554.00

No Bid 6.83 683.00 7.25 725.00 7.00 700.00 10.00 1,000.00 7.77 777.00

No Bid 7.11 568.80 7.55 604.00 7.25 580.00 10.00 800.00 7.81 624.80

No Bid 7.40 592.00 7.86 628.80 7.50 600.00 10.00 800.00 7.81 624.80

No Bid 7.71 154.20 8.20 164.00 7.75 155.00 10.00 200.00 8.47 169.40

No Bid 8.30 83.00 8.81 88.10 8.15 81.50 10.00 100.00 8.47 84.70

No Bid $6,382.16 $6,778.60 $6,767.50 $9,021.00 $6,985.52

11.65 582.50 22.15 1,107.50 29.26 1,463.00 30.33 1,516.50 29.00 1,450.00 58.50 2,925.00

4.15 103.75 1.70 42.50 3.23 80.75 No Bid No Bid 3.86 96.50

No Bid No Bid 11.04 552.00 No Bid No Bid 8.68 434.00

29.35 1,761.00 2.34 140.40 4.05 243.00 No Bid No Bid 2.44 146.40

3.55 1,065.00 3.23 969.00 5.60 1,680.00 No Bid No Bid 3.22 966.00

21.80 218.00 13.27 132.70 22.61 226.10 No Bid No Bid 20.50 205.00

5.20 312.00 11.85 711.00 No Bid 9.00 540.00 No Bid 5.15 309.00

17.70 708.00 7.95 318.00 18.60 744.00 No Bid No Bid 16.87 674.80

85.25 1,278.75 No Bid No Bid 68.00 1,020.00 94.00 1,410.00 97.99 1,469.85

12.80 409.60 19.39 620.48 No Bid 18.50 592.00 19.00 608.00 12.40 396.80

3.80 760.00 1.29 258.00 1.45 290.00 1.45 290.00 1.99 398.00 2.33 466.00

23.80 285.60 23.52 282.24 22.86 274.32 24.50 294.00 23.99 287.88 22.05 264.60

13.25 530.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.25 370.00 6.13 245.20

19.55 234.60 19.32 231.84 18.36 220.32 18.75 225.00 20.40 244.80 18.58 222.96

3.80 3,800.00 1.35 1,350.00 1.45 1,450.00 1.45 1,450.00 2.39 2,390.00 2.32 2,320.00

15.25 549.00 16.00 576.00 16.11 579.96 16.50 594.00 16.49 593.64 14.84 534.24

12.85 642.50 12.70 635.00 12.10 605.00 13.75 687.50 13.40 670.00 11.90 595.00

3.87 6,966.00 No Bid No Bid 3.90 7,020.00 4.10 7,380.00 3.61 6,498.00

$20,206.30 $7,374.66 $8,408.45 $14,229.00 $15,802.32 $18,769.35

All Safe Industries, 

Inc. Safety Supply, Inc. Texas Safety Supply

Northern Safety Co., 

Inc.

Magid Glove & 

Safety Mfg. Co., 

LLC

Lone Star Safety & 

Supply
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 5 - Cones, Safety Vest, Flags/Flagging

2016-003--05-01 Safety Vest - Size Large 200 each

2016-003--05-02 Safety Vest - Size X-Large 200 each

2016-003--05-03 Safety Vest - Size 2X-Large 100 each

2016-003--05-04 Safety Vest - Size 3X-Large 50 each

2016-003--05-05 Safety Vest - Size 4X-Large 25 each

2016-003--05-06 Safety Vest - Size 5X-Large 25 each

2016-003--05-07 Warning Flags 30 each

2016-003--05-08 Orange Traffic Cones 400 each

2016-003--05-09 Green Safety Cones 200 each

2016-003--05-10 Fluorescent Orange Flagging 400 each

2016-003--05-11 Yellow Caution Tape 50 each

2016-003--05-12 Safety Grid Fence 12 each

Total Group 5

Minimum dollar amount per order

Signature Page

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

No Bid 7.03 1,406.00 7.61 1,522.00 7.02 1,404.00 No Bid 7.87 1,574.00

No Bid 7.03 1,406.00 7.61 1,522.00 7.02 1,404.00 No Bid 7.87 1,574.00

No Bid 7.03 703.00 7.61 761.00 7.02 702.00 No Bid 7.87 787.00

No Bid 7.03 351.50 7.61 380.50 7.02 351.00 No Bid 7.87 393.50

No Bid 7.03 175.75 7.61 190.25 7.02 175.50 No Bid 7.87 196.75

No Bid 7.03 175.75 7.61 190.25 7.02 175.50 No Bid 7.87 196.75

No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.00 390.00 No Bid 2.71 81.30

No Bid 17.55 7,020.00 15.99 6,396.00 17.00 6,800.00 17.00 6,800.00 14.79 5,916.00

No Bid 20.15 4,030.00 18.35 3,670.00 No Bid 26.00 5,200.00 16.99 3,398.00

No Bid No Bid 2.53 1,012.00 No Bid No Bid 1.25 500.00

No Bid 6.35 317.50 13.99 699.50 6.50 325.00 8.90 445.00 6.88 344.00

No Bid 66.67 800.04 24.93 299.16 25.00 300.00 No Bid 24.20 290.40

No Bid $16,385.54 $16,642.66 $12,027.00 $12,445.00 $15,251.70

$50.00 $0.00 $100.00 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

$69,826.88 $71,703.21 $71,010.25 $74,463.25 $79,911.97 $83,240.67

(717.03) (744.63) (799.12) (1,664.81)

69,826.88$  70,986.18$  71,010.25$  73,718.62$  79,112.85$  81,575.86$  

Not Stated 14 Calendar Days 15 Calendar Days 1-2 Calendar Days 2-14 Calendar Days10 Calendar Days

1% 20 Calendar Days 2% 20 Calendar DaysNet 30 1% 10 Calendar Days Net 30 1% 10 Calendar Days

Northern Safety Co., 

Inc.

Magid Glove & 

Safety Mfg. Co., 

LLC

Lone Star Safety & 

Supply

All Safe Industries, 

Inc. Safety Supply, Inc. Texas Safety Supply
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 1 - Gloves

2016-003--01-01 Side Leather Palm Gloves 600 pair

2016-003--01-02 Vinyl Coated Gloves 600 pair

2016-003--01-03 Large Heavy Weight Cotton/Polly Glove Liner 8400 pair

2016-003--01-04 Double Palm Work Glove 360 pair

2016-003--01-05 Heavy Duty Side Split Work Glove 120 pair

2016-003--01-06 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 300 pair

2016-003--01-07 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 3000 pair

2016-003--01-08 Black PVC Gloves 60 pair

2016-003--01-09 Large PVC Gloves 200 pair

2016-003--01-10 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 120 pair

2016-003--01-11 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 400 pair

2016-003--01-12 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 1000 pair

2016-003--01-13 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 900 pair

2016-003--01-14 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 200 pair

2016-003--01-15 Medium Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box

2016-003--01-16 Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box

2016-003--01-17 Extra Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 360 box

Total Group 1

Group 2 - Boots and Liners

2016-003--02-01 PVC Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-02 PVC Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-03 PVC Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-04 PVC Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-05 PVC Boots 60 pair

2016-003--02-06 PVC Boots 70 pair

2016-003--02-07 PVC Boots 50 pair

2016-003--02-08 PVC Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-09 PVC Boots 10 pair

2016-003--02-10 PVC Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-11 PVC Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-12 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-13 Hip Wader Boots 15 pair

2016-003--02-14 Hip Wader Boots 30 pair

2016-003--02-15 Hip Wader Boots 20 pair

2016-003--02-16 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-17 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair

2016-003--02-18 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair

2016-003--02-19 Hip Wader Boots 3 pair

2016-003--02-20 Medium Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

2016-003--02-21 Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

2016-003--02-22 Extra Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair

Total Group 2

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

2.35 1,410.00 3.07 1,842.00 3.0325 1,819.50 2.10 1,260.00 1.60 960.00 1.79 1,074.00

1.41 846.00 2.69 1,614.00 2.26 1,356.00 1.25 750.00 1.30 780.00 198.72 119,232.00

0.33 2,772.00 0.55 4,620.00 0.7692 6,461.28 0.30 2,520.00 0.30 2,520.00 0.35 2,940.00

3.23 1,162.80 3.86 1,389.60 3.9092 1,407.312 2.85 1,026.00 1.82 655.20 2.21 795.60

8.56 1,027.20 8.43 1,011.60 11.0483 1,325.796 7.55 906.00 7.76 931.20 6.44 772.80

0.48 144.00 1.83 549.00 0.6925 207.75 0.40 120.00 0.84 252.00 6.08 1,824.00

0.48 1,440.00 1.18 3,540.00 0.6925 2,077.50 0.40 1,200.00 0.39 1,170.00 6.08 18,240.00

1.99 119.40 2.74 164.40 2.65 159.00 1.75 105.00 1.70 102.00 2.03 121.80

3.94 788.00 4.37 874.00 5.355 1,071.00 3.45 690.00 3.55 710.00 4.20 840.00

6.33 759.60 4.04 484.80 8.0833 969.996 3.75 450.00 4.18 501.60 6.29 754.80

6.33 2,532.00 4.04 1,616.00 8.245 3,298.00 3.75 1,500.00 4.18 1,672.00 6.29 2,516.00

6.33 6,330.00 4.04 4,040.00 8.148 8,148.00 3.75 3,750.00 4.18 4,180.00 6.29 6,290.00

6.46 5,814.00 4.04 3,636.00 8.30 7,470.00 3.89 3,501.00 4.35 3,915.00 6.44 5,796.00

6.70 1,340.00 4.04 808.00 8.755 1,751.00 4.05 810.00 4.48 896.00 6.67 1,334.00

9.79 2,937.00 11.14 3,342.00 13.04 3,912.00 9.55 2,865.00 11.00 3,300.00 4.49 1,347.00

9.79 2,937.00 11.14 3,342.00 13.04 3,912.00 9.55 2,865.00 11.00 3,300.00 4.49 1,347.00

9.79 3,524.40 11.14 4,010.40 13.04 4,694.40 9.55 3,438.00 11.00 3,960.00 4.49 1,616.40

$35,883.40 $36,883.80 $50,040.534 $27,756.00 $29,805.00 $166,841.40

15.64 46.92 21.55 64.65 31.29 93.87 13.20 39.60 15.80 47.40 No Bid

15.64 93.84 21.55 129.30 31.29 187.74 13.20 79.20 15.80 94.80 15.33 91.98

15.64 250.24 21.55 344.80 31.29 500.64 13.20 211.20 15.80 252.80 15.33 245.28

15.64 312.80 21.55 431.00 31.29 625.80 13.20 264.00 15.80 316.00 15.33 306.60

15.64 938.40 21.55 1,293.00 29.85 1,791.00 13.20 792.00 15.80 948.00 15.33 919.80

15.64 1,094.80 21.55 1,508.50 29.85 2,089.50 13.20 924.00 15.80 1,106.00 15.33 1,073.10

15.64 782.00 21.55 1,077.50 29.85 1,492.50 13.20 660.00 15.80 790.00 15.33 766.50

15.64 312.80 21.55 431.00 29.85 597.00 13.20 264.00 15.80 316.00 15.33 306.60

15.64 156.40 21.55 215.50 29.85 298.50 13.20 132.00 15.80 158.00 15.33 153.30

15.64 93.84 No Bid No Bid 13.20 79.20 No Bid 15.33 91.98

15.64 46.92 No Bid No Bid 13.20 39.60 No Bid 52.27 156.81

64.49 386.94 66.01 396.06 No Bid 54.35 326.10 63.30 379.80 57.83 346.98

64.49 967.35 66.01 990.15 No Bid 54.35 815.25 63.30 949.50 57.83 867.45

64.49 1,934.70 66.01 1,980.30 No Bid 54.35 1,630.50 63.30 1,899.00 57.83 1,734.90

64.49 1,289.80 66.01 1,320.20 No Bid 54.35 1,087.00 63.30 1,266.00 57.83 1,156.60

64.49 1,031.84 66.01 1,056.16 No Bid 54.35 869.60 63.30 1,012.80 57.83 925.28

64.49 1,031.84 66.01 1,056.16 No Bid 54.35 869.60 63.30 1,012.80 57.83 925.28

64.49 386.94 66.01 396.06 No Bid 54.35 326.10 63.30 379.80 57.83 346.98

64.49 193.47 No Bid No Bid 54.35 163.05 63.30 189.90 15.33 45.99

14.93 447.90 9.76 292.80 18.17 545.10 12.60 378.00 13.50 405.00 13.27 398.10

14.93 447.90 9.76 292.80 18.17 545.10 12.60 378.00 13.50 405.00 13.27 398.10

14.93 447.90 9.76 292.80 18.17 545.10 12.60 378.00 13.50 405.00 13.27 398.10

$12,695.54 $13,568.74 $9,311.85 $10,706.00 $12,333.60 $11,655.71

MSC Industrial Supply

All Safe Industries, 

Inc. (alternate) Mastermans, LLP VWR International, LLC Abatix Corp Saf-T-Glove, Inc.
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 3 - Rain Gear

2016-003--03-01 Trench Coats - Size Small 4 each

2016-003--03-02 Trench Coats - Size Medium 12 each

2016-003--03-03 Trench Coats - Size Large 100 each

2016-003--03-04 Trench Coats - Size X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-05 Trench Coats - Size 2X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-06 Trench Coats - Size 3X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-07 Trench Coats - Size 4X-Large 30 each

2016-003--03-08 Trench Coats - Size 5X-Large 20 each

2016-003--03-09 Rain Suits - Size Small 4 each

2016-003--03-10 Rain Suits - Size Medium 12 each

2016-003--03-11 Rain Suits - Size Large 200 each

2016-003--03-12 Rain Suits - Size X-Large 100 each

2016-003--03-13 Rain Suits - Size 2X-Large 80 each

2016-003--03-14 Rain Suits - Size 3X-Large 80 each

2016-003--03-15 Rain Suits - Size 4X-Large 20 each

2016-003--03-16 Rain Suits - Size 5X-Large 10 each

Total Group 3

Group 4 - First Aid & Personal Safety Items

2016-003--04-01 First Aid Kit 50 each

2016-003--04-02 TECNU Poison Oak & Ivy Cleaner 4 oz. 25 each

2016-003--04-03 TECNU Extreme Cleanser 4 oz. Tube 50 each

2016-003--04-04 Ivy Block - pre contact lotion 4 oz. 60 each

2016-003--04-05 Sun-X SPF30 Sunscreen 4 oz. 300 each

2016-003--04-06 Leather Kneepads 10 pair

2016-003--04-07 Regular Brim Safety Hat 60 each

2016-003--04-08 Plastic Capped Knee Pads 40 pair

2016-003--04-09 Ear Plugs 15 box

2016-003--04-10 Foam Corded Ear Plugs 32 box

2016-003--04-11 Clear Safety Glasses 200 each

2016-003--04-12 Half Facepiece Respirator 12 each

2016-003--04-13 Ear Muff Hearing Protector 40 each

2016-003--04-14 Organic Vapor / Acid Gas Cartridge 12 pair

2016-003--04-15 Tinted Safety Glasses 1000 each

2016-003--04-16 Full Brim Safety Hat 36 each

2016-003--04-17 Respirator Dust Mask 50 box

2016-003--04-18 Gatorade Sport Drink 1800 each

Total Group 4

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

6.25 25.00 8.00 32.00 9.06 36.24 5.55 22.20 5.38 21.52 6.07 24.28

6.25 75.00 8.00 96.00 9.06 108.72 5.55 66.60 5.38 64.56 6.07 72.84

6.25 625.00 8.00 800.00 9.06 906.00 5.55 555.00 5.38 538.00 6.07 607.00

6.25 625.00 8.00 800.00 9.06 906.00 5.55 555.00 5.38 538.00 6.07 607.00

6.25 625.00 8.00 800.00 9.06 906.00 5.75 575.00 5.38 538.00 6.39 639.00

6.70 670.00 8.00 800.00 9.70 970.00 5.95 595.00 5.75 575.00 6.72 672.00

7.03 210.90 8.70 261.00 10.18 305.40 6.25 187.50 6.05 181.50 7.04 211.20

7.34 146.80 8.97 179.40 10.64 212.80 6.50 130.00 6.30 126.00 7.33 146.60

7.25 29.00 9.15 36.60 10.50 42.00 6.85 27.40 5.00 20.00 17.33 69.32

7.25 87.00 9.15 109.80 10.50 126.00 6.85 82.20 5.00 60.00 3.60 43.20

7.25 1,450.00 9.15 1,830.00 10.50 2,100.00 6.85 1,370.00 5.00 1,000.00 3.60 720.00

7.25 725.00 9.15 915.00 10.50 1,050.00 6.85 685.00 5.00 500.00 3.80 380.00

7.55 604.00 9.15 732.00 10.94 875.20 6.90 552.00 5.15 412.00 4.00 320.00

7.86 628.80 9.15 732.00 11.40 912.00 7.00 560.00 5.15 412.00 7.99 639.20

8.20 164.00 9.61 192.20 11.86 237.20 7.25 145.00 5.15 103.00 8.29 165.80

8.81 88.10 9.61 96.10 12.76 127.60 7.50 75.00 5.15 51.50 16.48 164.80

$6,778.60 $8,412.10 $9,821.16 $6,182.90 $5,141.08 $5,482.24

29.26 1,463.00 34.54 1,727.00 42.12 2,106.00 22.80 1,140.00 27.25 1,362.50 No Bid

3.23 80.75 12.91 322.75 227.51 5,687.75 9.40 235.00 4.65 116.25 No Bid

11.04 552.00 18.47 923.50 227.51 11,375.50 18.85 942.50 10.25 512.50 No Bid

4.05 243.00 10.46 627.60 227.51 13,650.60 3.25 195.00 8.00 480.00 No Bid

5.60 1,680.00 3.71 1,113.00 155.92 46,776.00 3.99 1,197.00 4.75 1,425.00 4.89 1,467.00

22.61 226.10 19.88 198.80 33.20 332.00 16.30 163.00 No Bid 17.35 173.50

10.99 659.40 12.67 760.20 10.2583 615.498 7.65 459.00 5.20 312.00 6.27 376.20

18.60 744.00 15.62 624.80 No Bid 13.40 536.00 10.25 410.00 8.92 356.80

95.65 1,434.75 83.50 1,252.50 103.46 1,551.90 0.82 12.30 84.75 1,271.25 82.47 1,237.05

22.63 724.16 23.86 763.52 21.29 681.28 16.60 531.20 17.00 544.00 64.80 2,073.60

1.45 290.00 1.90 380.00 0.7412 148.24 1.49 298.00 1.22 244.00 11.69 2,338.00

22.86 274.32 28.72 344.64 34.87 418.44 20.75 249.00 21.65 259.80 23.52 282.24

6.33 253.20 15.29 611.60 15.34 613.60 7.10 284.00 12.95 518.00 3.93 157.20

18.36 220.32 25.10 301.20 29.22 350.64 8.60 103.20 17.85 214.20 19.32 231.84

1.45 1,450.00 1.86 1,860.00 3.7699 3,769.90 1.20 1,200.00 1.29 1,290.00 1.60 1,600.00

16.11 579.96 14.66 527.76 21.02 756.72 14.75 531.00 7.10 255.60 8.37 301.32

12.10 605.00 19.39 969.50 19.73 986.50 11.25 562.50 11.76 588.00 15.12 756.00

3.85 6,930.00 4.49 8,082.00 4.8124 8,662.32 105.60 190,080.00 105.00 189,000.00 115.47 207,846.00

$18,409.96 $21,390.37 $98,482.888 $198,718.70 $198,803.10 $219,196.75

VWR International Abatix Corp Saf-T-Glove, Inc. MSC Industrial Supply

All Safe Industries, 

Inc. (alternate) Mastermans, LLP
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City of Mesquite

Bid Tabulation

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items

Bid Number: 2016-003

Date: October 15, 2015

Item Number Item Qty Unit

Group 5 - Cones, Safety Vest, Flags/Flagging

2016-003--05-01 Safety Vest - Size Large 200 each

2016-003--05-02 Safety Vest - Size X-Large 200 each

2016-003--05-03 Safety Vest - Size 2X-Large 100 each

2016-003--05-04 Safety Vest - Size 3X-Large 50 each

2016-003--05-05 Safety Vest - Size 4X-Large 25 each

2016-003--05-06 Safety Vest - Size 5X-Large 25 each

2016-003--05-07 Warning Flags 30 each

2016-003--05-08 Orange Traffic Cones 400 each

2016-003--05-09 Green Safety Cones 200 each

2016-003--05-10 Fluorescent Orange Flagging 400 each

2016-003--05-11 Yellow Caution Tape 50 each

2016-003--05-12 Safety Grid Fence 12 each

Total Group 5

Minimum dollar amount per order

Signature Page

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:

Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

7.61 1,522.00 7.87 1,574.00 23.92 4,784.00 6.55 1,310.00 6.25 1,250.00 8.00 1,600.00

7.61 1,522.00 7.87 1,574.00 23.92 4,784.00 6.55 1,310.00 6.25 1,250.00 7.73 1,546.00

7.61 761.00 7.87 787.00 23.92 2,392.00 6.55 655.00 6.25 625.00 11.27 1,127.00

7.61 380.50 7.87 393.50 24.82 1,241.00 6.55 327.50 6.25 312.50 11.27 563.50

7.61 190.25 8.21 205.25 25.92 648.00 6.55 163.75 6.25 156.25 11.27 281.75

7.61 190.25 8.50 212.50 No Bid 6.55 163.75 6.25 156.25 No Bid

2.65 79.50 9.92 297.60 No Bid 4.65 139.50 3.05 91.50 1.93 57.90

15.99 6,396.00 19.54 7,816.00 No Bid 14.60 5,840.00 14.75 5,900.00 11.40 4,560.00

18.35 3,670.00 21.47 4,294.00 No Bid 16.25 3,250.00 18.00 3,600.00 12.40 2,480.00

2.53 1,012.00 No Bid 39.61 15,844.00 2.70 1,080.00 1.30 520.00 0.84 336.00

13.99 699.50 20.81 1,040.50 27.29 1,364.50 4.70 235.00 6.10 305.00 8.09 404.50

24.93 299.16 No Bid 46.62 559.44 16.90 202.80 21.95 263.40 23.87 286.44

$16,722.16 $18,194.35 $31,616.94 $14,677.30 $14,429.90 $13,243.09

$100.00 $250.00 $0.00 $1.00 $50.00 $0.00

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

$90,489.66 $98,449.36 $199,273.37 $258,040.90 $260,512.68 $416,419.19

90,489.66$  98,449.36$  199,273.37$  258,040.90$  260,512.68$  416,419.19$  

30 Calendar Days 3-30 Days ARO 2 Calendar Days 3-5 Calendar Days Not Stated14 Calendar Days

Net 30 Net 30Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

MSC Industrial Supply

All Safe Industries, 

Inc. (alternate) Mastermans, LLP VWR International Abatix Corp Saf-T-Glove, Inc.
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