
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items
Bid Nunber: 2024-008
Date: November 16, 2023

Lot: GROUP 1

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

2024-008--01-01 Side Leather Palm Gloves 600 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.25 1350.00 2.1583 1294.98 4.24 2544.00
2024-008--01-02 Vinyl Coated Gloves 600 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.50 900.00 No Bid 3.49 2094.00
2024-008--01-03 Large Heavy Weight Cotton/Polly Glove Liner 8400 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.35 2940.00 0.3417 2870.28 0.84 7056.00
2024-008--01-04 Double Palm Work Glove 360 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.10 1116.00 3.3533 1207.188 6.41 2307.60
2024-008--01-05 Heavy Duty Side Split Work Glove 120 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.40 1248.00 10.1583 1218.996 17.87 2144.40
2024-008--01-06 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 300 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.30 390.00 0.61 183.00 1.63 489.00
2024-008--01-07 Brown Jersey Clute Cut Knit Wrist Gloves 3000 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.50 1500.00 0.61 1830.00 1.15 3450.00
2024-008--01-08 Black PVC Gloves 60 pair No Bid No Bid 2.20 132.00 2.35 141.00 2.585 155.10 8.09 485.40
2024-008--01-09 Large PVC Gloves 200 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.35 670.00 4.8783 975.66 9.22 1844.00
2024-008--01-10 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 120 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.70 324.00 5.0367 604.404 9.02 1082.40
2024-008--01-11 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 400 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.70 1080.00 5.0367 2014.68 8.15 3260.00
2024-008--01-12 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 1000 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.70 2700.00 5.0367 5036.70 8.15 8150.00
2024-008--01-13 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 900 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.70 2430.00 5.2192 4697.28 8.66 7794.00
2024-008--01-14 Grain Cowhide Drivers Gloves 200 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.70 540.00 5.2191 1043.82 17.93 3586.00
2024-008--01-15 Medium Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 1800.00 20.73 6219.00 7.53 2259.00
2024-008--01-16 Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 300 box No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 1800.00 20.73 6219.00 7.53 2259.00
2024-008--01-17 Extra Large Nitrile Glove lightly powdered 360 box No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 2160.00 20.73 7462.80 7.21 2595.60

Total Group 1 No Bid No Bid $132.00 $23,089.00 $43,032.89 $53,400.40

Lot: GROUP 2

 
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

2024-008--02-01 PVC Boots 3 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 44.85 39.61 118.83 No Bid
2024-008--02-02 PVC Boots 6 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 89.70 39.61 237.66 No Bid
2024-008--02-03 PVC Boots 16 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 239.20 39.61 633.76 No Bid
2024-008--02-04 PVC Boots 20 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 299.00 39.61 792.20 No Bid
2024-008--02-05 PVC Boots 60 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 897.00 39.61 2376.60 No Bid
2024-008--02-06 PVC Boots 70 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 1046.50 39.61 2772.70 No Bid
2024-008--02-07 PVC Boots 50 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 747.50 39.61 1980.50 No Bid
2024-008--02-08 PVC Boots 20 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 299.00 39.61 792.20 No Bid
2024-008--02-09 PVC Boots 10 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 149.50 39.61 396.10 No Bid
2024-008--02-10 PVC Boots 6 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.95 89.70 39.61 237.66 No Bid
2024-008--02-11 PVC Boots 3 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.95 53.85 No Bid No Bid
2024-008--02-12 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 297.00 99.70 598.2 142.14 852.84
2024-008--02-13 Hip Wader Boots 15 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 742.50 97.305 1459.575 176.99 2654.85
2024-008--02-14 Hip Wader Boots 30 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 1485.00 99.48 2984.40 176.99 5309.70
2024-008--02-15 Hip Wader Boots 20 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 990.00 99.48 1989.60 221.99 4439.80
2024-008--02-16 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 792.00 99.70 1595.20 221.99 3551.84
2024-008--02-17 Hip Wader Boots 16 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 792.00 99.70 1595.20 221.99 3551.84
2024-008--02-18 Hip Wader Boots 6 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 297.00 99.70 598.20 176.99 1061.94
2024-008--02-19 Hip Wader Boots 3 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.50 148.50 99.70 299.10 No Bid
2024-008--02-20 Medium Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.75 442.50 21.51 645.30 35.96 1078.80
2024-008--02-21 Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.75 442.50 21.51 645.30 48.25 1447.50
2024-008--02-22 Extra Large Insulated Boot Liner 30 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.75 442.50 21.512 645.36 35.38 1151.40

Total Group 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,827.30 $23,393.65 $25,100.51

Centerline Supply, Inc.

Centerline Supply, Inc.

Security Safety

Security Safety

Texas Meter & Device 
Co., LLC

Texas Meter & Device 
Co., LLC

Agni Enterprises, LLC 
dba Head to Heels 

Safety Supplies

Agni Enterprises, LLC 
dba Head to Heels 

Safety Supplies

Centerline Supply, Inc. 
ALT

Centerline Supply, Inc. 
ALT

All In Safety Corp

All In Safety Corp
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items
Bid Nunber: 2024-008
Date: November 16, 2023

Lot: GROUP 3

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

2024-008--03-01 Trench Coats - Size Small 4 each No Bid No Bid 9.96 39.84 7.65 30.60 7.40 29.60 33.57 134.28
2024-008--03-02 Trench Coats - Size Medium 12 each No Bid No Bid 9.95 119.40 7.65 91.80 7.40 88.80 31.69 380.28
2024-008--03-03 Trench Coats - Size Large 100 each No Bid No Bid 9.95 995.00 7.65 765.00 7.40 740.00 15.17 1517.00
2024-008--03-04 Trench Coats - Size X-Large 100 each No Bid No Bid 9.95 995.00 7.65 765.00 7.40 740.00 15.18 1518.00
2024-008--03-05 Trench Coats - Size 2X-Large 100 each No Bid No Bid 9.95 995.00 7.65 765.00 7.40 740.00 15.18 1518.00
2024-008--03-06 Trench Coats - Size 3X-Large 100 each No Bid No Bid 9.95 995.00 7.65 765.00 7.91 791.00 16.09 1609.00
2024-008--03-07 Trench Coats - Size 4X-Large 30 each No Bid No Bid 9.95 298.50 7.65 229.50 8.30 249.00 22.54 676.20
2024-008--03-08 Trench Coats - Size 5X-Large 20 each No Bid No Bid 9.95 199.00 7.65 153.00 8.68 173.60 33.31 666.20
2024-008--03-09 Rain Suits - Size Small 4 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 51.80 9.00 36.00 8.90 35.60 34.18 136.72
2024-008--03-10 Rain Suits - Size Medium 12 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 155.40 9.50 114.00 8.90 106.80 34.23 410.76
2024-008--03-11 Rain Suits - Size Large 200 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 2590.00 9.50 1900.00 8.90 1780.00 18.08 3616.00
2024-008--03-12 Rain Suits - Size X-Large 100 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 1295.00 9.50 950.00 8.98 898.00 17.43 1743.00
2024-008--03-13 Rain Suits - Size 2X-Large 80 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 1036.00 9.50 760.00 8.98 718.40 19.14 1531.20
2024-008--03-14 Rain Suits - Size 3X-Large 80 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 1036.00 9.50 760.00 9.85 788.00 21.19 1695.20
2024-008--03-15 Rain Suits - Size 4X-Large 20 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 259.00 9.50 190.00 9.99 199.80 35.88 717.60
2024-008--03-16 Rain Suits - Size 5X-Large 10 each No Bid No Bid 12.95 129.50 9.50 95.00 10.73 107.30 35.54 355.40

Total Group 3 No Bid No Bid $11,189.44 $8,369.90 $8,185.90 $18,224.84

Lot: GROUP 4

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

2024-008--04-01 First Aid Kit 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.50 1225.00 33.39 1669.50 No Bid
2024-008--04-02 TECNU Poison Oak & Ivy Cleaner 4 oz. 25 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.25 181.25 4.8283 120.7075 19.79 494.75
2024-008--04-03 TECNU Extreme Cleanser 4 oz. Tube 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.95 847.50 7.86 393.00 No Bid
2024-008--04-04 Ivy Block - pre contact lotion 4 oz. 60 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.45 207.00 12.0325 721.95 7.92 475.20
2024-008--04-05 Sun-X SPF30 Sunscreen 4 oz. 300 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.60 2580.00 7.86 2358.00 15.78 4734.00
2024-008--04-06 Leather Kneepads 10 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.95 179.50 26.46 264.60 49.66 496.60
2024-008--04-07 Regular Brim Safety Hat 60 each No Bid No Bid 10.95 657.00 6.50 390.00 14.21 852.60 No Bid
2024-008--04-08 Plastic Capped Knee Pads 40 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.50 460.00 18.78 751.20 33.26 1330.40
2024-008--04-09 Ear Plugs 15 box No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00 675.00 71.59 1073.85 No Bid
2024-008--04-10 Foam Corded Ear Plugs 32 box No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 480.00 31.71 1014.72 42.42 1357.44
2024-008--04-11 Clear Safety Glasses 200 each No Bid No Bid 1.09 218.00 1.35 270.00 0.2181 43.62 3.2 640.00000
2024-008--04-12 Half Facepiece Respirator 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00 180.00 31.85 382.20 62.22 746.64
2024-008--04-13 Ear Muff Hearing Protector 40 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.95 238.00 24.35 974.00 26.09 1043.60
2024-008--04-14 Organic Vapor / Acid Gas Cartridge 12 pair No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.00 324.00 13.21 158.52 57.28 687.36
2024-008--04-15 Tinted Safety Glasses 1000 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.35 1350.00 4.07 4070.00 2.1 2100.00
2024-008--04-16 Full Brim Safety Hat 36 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.55 307.80 22.01 792.36 32.55 1171.80
2024-008--04-17 Respirator Dust Mask 50 box No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.50 625.00 19.07 953.50 202.54 10127.00
2024-008--04-18 Gatorade Sport Drink 1800 each No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.75 10350.00 4.37 7866.00 7.08 12744.00

Total Group 4 No Bid No Bid $875.00 $20,870.05 $24,460.3275 $38,148.79

Centerline Supply, Inc.

Centerline Supply, Inc.

All In Safety Corp

All In Safety Corp

Security Safety

Security Safety

Texas Meter & Device 
Co., LLC

Texas Meter & Device 
Co., LLC

Agni Enterprises, LLC 
dba Head to Heels 

Safety Supplies

Agni Enterprises, LLC 
dba Head to Heels 

Safety Supplies

Centerline Supply, Inc. 
ALT

Centerline Supply, Inc. 
ALT
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Safety Items
Bid Nunber: 2024-008
Date: November 16, 2023

Lot: GROUP 5

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

2024-008--05-01 Safety Vest - Size Large 200 each 11.69 2338.00 10.26 2052.00 No Bid 7.25 1450.00 7.37 1474.00 17.69 3538.00
2024-008--05-02 Safety Vest - Size X-Large 200 each 11.69 2338.00 10.26 2052.00 No Bid 7.25 1450.00 7.37 1474.00 20.54 4108.00
2024-008--05-03 Safety Vest - Size 2X-Large 100 each 11.69 1169.00 10.26 1026.00 No Bid 7.25 725.00 7.37 737.00 16.12 1612.00
2024-008--05-04 Safety Vest - Size 3X-Large 50 each 11.69 584.50 10.26 513.00 No Bid 5.25 262.50 7.37 368.50 22.71 1135.50
2024-008--05-05 Safety Vest - Size 4X-Large 25 each 11.69 292.25 10.26 256.50 No Bid 5.25 131.25 7.37 184.25 27.24 681.00
2024-008--05-06 Safety Vest - Size 5X-Large 25 each 11.69 292.25 10.26 256.50 No Bid 5.25 131.25 7.37 184.25 30.9 772.50
2024-008--05-07 Warning Flags 30 each No Bid 3.21 96.30 No Bid 2.25 67.50 5.32 159.60 15.07 452.10
2024-008--05-08 Orange Traffic Cones 400 each No Bid 18.51 7404.00 13.95 5580.00 22.00 8800.00 21.55 8620.00 40.28 16112.00
2024-008--05-09 Green Safety Cones 200 each No Bid 21.26 4252.00 13.95 2790.00 25.00 5000.00 24.72 4944.00 41.07 8214.00
2024-008--05-10 Fluorescent Orange Flagging 400 each No Bid 1.79 716.00 No Bid 1.70 680.00 2.3317 932.68 3.53 1412.00
2024-008--05-11 Yellow Caution Tape 50 each No Bid 11.00 550.00 5.95 297.50 5.60 280.00 8.98 449.00 10.68 534.00
2024-008--05-12 Safety Grid Fence 12 each No Bid 63.38 760.56 20.95 251.4 25.50 306.00 38.39 460.68 51.91 622.92

Total Group 5 $7,014.00 $19,934.86 $8,918.90 $19,283.50 $19,987.96 $39,194.02

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Centerline Supply, Inc.

$19,934.86

$19,934.86
Net 30
30 Calendar Days 7-10 Calendar Days

$21,115.34

$21,115.34
Net 30

All In Safety Corp

$119,060.7205
Net 30
Not stated

Security Safety

$82,439.75

$82,439.75
Net 30
Not stated

$119,060.7205

Texas Meter & Device 
Co., LLC

$170,587.1888
2% Net 5
7-14 Calendar Days

$174,068.56
-3,481.3712

Agni Enterprises, LLC 
dba Head to Heels 

Safety Supplies

$7,014.00

$7,014.00

Centerline Supply, Inc. 
ALT

Net 30
30 Calendar Days
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