

CITY OF MESQUITE
 BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Ammunition
 Bid Number: 2021-016
 Lot: Group I Target Load Ammunition
 Date: November 17, 2020

Item Number	Item Description	Qty	Unit	Precision Delta Corp		Proforce Law Enforcement		GT Distributors Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
2021-016--01-01	9mm 147 Grain FMJ Bullet	160	thousand	208.96	33,433.60	233.27	37,323.20	218.49	34,958.40
2021-016--01-02	.40 S&W 155-180 Grain FMJ Bullet	15	thousand	215.00	3,225.00	298.46	4,476.90	294.71	4,420.65
2021-016--01-03	.45 ACP 230 Grain FMJ Bullet	15	thousand	257.00	3,855.00	324.40	4,866.00	335.30	5,029.50
2021-016--01-04	.223 55-Grain FMJ Bullet	120	thousand	324.96	38,995.20	345.36	41,443.20	411.10	49,332.00
2021-016--01-05	Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Red	10	thousand		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
2021-016--01-06	Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Blue	10	thousand		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
2021-016--01-07	Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Yellow	4	thousand		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
2021-016--01-08	Simmunition - 9mm Grain - Green	4	thousand		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
2021-016--01-09	9mm 100 Grain RHT	1	thousand	399.00	399.00		No Bid	451.90	451.90
2021-016--01-10	.40 S&W 125 Grain RHT	1	thousand	475.00	475.00		No Bid	472.20	472.20
2021-016--01-11	.45 ACP 155 Grain RHT	1	thousand	592.00	592.00		No Bid	599.36	599.36
2021-016--01-12	.223 Rem 42 Grain RHT	1	thousand	629.00	629.00		No Bid	996.69	996.69
	Group I - Target Load Ammunition - Total				\$ 79,508.80		88,109.30		96,260.70
					Recommended				

