
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Page 1 of 16

Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1.
General Carpenter, Drywall:  Tape and Bed, 

Texture, Painting, Wall Covering
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 20.75         20.75         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 31.00         31.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 31.00         31.00         No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

2. Floor Tile
Commercial Grade VCT Installation 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 1.25           1.25           No Bid
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 0.75           0.75           No Bid
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 0.75           0.75           No Bid
Rubber cove base installation per lineal foot 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 1.25           1.25           No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

3. Carpet
Carpet tiles installed 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 0.75           0.75           No Bid
Roll carpet installed 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 0.75           0.75           No Bid
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 0.75           0.75           No Bid
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 0.75           0.75           No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

4. Laminate Wood Flooring
Installation 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 1.75           1.75           No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

5. Heating, Venting and Air Conditioning
Superintendant
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid 75.00         75.00         No Bid No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid 105.00       105.00       No Bid No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid 105.00       105.00       No Bid No Bid
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid 105.00       105.00       No Bid No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid 105.00       105.00       No Bid No Bid
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid 55.00         55.00         No Bid No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid 80.00         80.00         No Bid No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid 80.00         80.00         No Bid No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid 15% No Bid No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Artex Overhead Door Co. Berger Engineering 
Company

Concord Commercial 
Services, Inc.

Control Systems 
Consultants



CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Page 2 of 16

Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
6. Plumbing

Master Plumber
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 66.00         66.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 95.00         95.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 95.00         95.00         No Bid

Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 53.00         53.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 78.00         78.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 78.00         78.00         No Bid
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 40.00         40.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 58.00         58.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 58.00         58.00         No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

7. Electrical
Master Electrician
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 45.00         45.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 65.00         65.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 65.00         65.00         No Bid
Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 36.00         36.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 52.00         52.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 52.00         52.00         No Bid
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 25.00         25.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 37.00         37.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 37.00         37.00         No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

8. Overhead Door Repair
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr 75.00         75.00         No Bid 62.00         62.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr 90.00         90.00         No Bid 92.00         92.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr 100.00       100.00       No Bid 92.00         92.00         No Bid
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr 40.00         40.00         No Bid 35.00         35.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr 50.00         50.00         No Bid 52.00         52.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr 65.00         65.00         No Bid 52.00         52.00         No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) 25% No Bid 15% No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Artex Overhead Door Co. Berger Engineering 
Company

Concord Commercial 
Services, Inc.

Control Systems 
Consultants



CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
9. Glass Replacement

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 60.00         60.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 88.00         88.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 88.00         88.00         No Bid
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid 36.00         36.00         No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid 52.00         52.00         No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid 52.00         52.00         No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

10. Roofing
Composition Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 1.60           1.60           No Bid
Tar and Gravel Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 8.00           8.00           No Bid
Roof Coating
All inclusive surface preparation and coating 1 sq. ft. No Bid No Bid 1.45           1.45           No Bid
Roof Repairs 1 hr No Bid No Bid 45.00         45.00         No Bid
Installation of metal edging and wall flashing 1 Lft. No Bid No Bid 8.00           8.00           No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

11. Building Automation Controls
Service Technician
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid 90.00         90.00         
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid 135.00       135.00       
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid 180.00       180.00       
Engineering and Programming
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00         50.00         
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.00         75.00         
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid 100.00       100.00       
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

12. Irrigation
Irrigator
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Labor / Helper
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Artex Overhead Door Co. Berger Engineering 
Company

Concord Commercial 
Services, Inc.

Control Systems 
Consultants



CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
13. Water treatment of HVAC cooling towers 

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr No Bid 50.00         50.00         No Bid No Bid
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr No Bid 75.00         75.00         No Bid No Bid
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr No Bid 75.00         75.00         No Bid No Bid
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable) No Bid 15% No Bid No Bid

14. Material Markup (%)
Includes all materials for all projects/jobs 1 pct 25% 30% 15% 1.25%

Vendors shall supply an explanation and list 
dollar amounts of other charges not included in 
above:  This includes trip charges and fuel 
surcharges.

Emergency Response Time following 
notification for all trades

Irrigation Emergency Repair response time
Golf Course - Same Day N/A N/A N/A N/A
Park Maintenance - 48 Hours N/A N/A N/A N/A

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Artex Overhead Door Co. Berger Engineering 
Company

Concord Commercial 
Services, Inc.

Control Systems 
Consultants

Every service call to a 
single location will include 
a $50.00 truck charge

Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Days 1.7% 10 Days

Awarded Bid Awarded Bid Awarded Bid Awarded Bid

same day 2 hours 2 hours 60 minutes



CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT

1.
General Carpenter, Drywall:  Tape and Bed, 

Texture, Painting, Wall Covering
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

2. Floor Tile
Commercial Grade VCT Installation 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft.
Rubber cove base installation per lineal foot 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

3. Carpet
Carpet tiles installed 1 sq. ft.
Roll carpet installed 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

4. Laminate Wood Flooring
Installation 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

5. Heating, Venting and Air Conditioning
Superintendant
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

23.35         23.35         No Bid 45.00         45.00         No Bid
35.00         35.02         No Bid 60.00         60.00         No Bid
46.70         46.70         No Bid 60.00         60.00         No Bid

15% No Bid 20% No Bid

0.80           0.80           No Bid 2.38           2.38           No Bid
0.45           0.45           No Bid 0.96           0.96           No Bid
0.25           0.25           No Bid 0.96           0.96           No Bid
0.75           0.75           No Bid 2.16           2.16           No Bid

15% No Bid 20% No Bid

0.75           0.75           No Bid 1.02           1.02           No Bid
0.45           0.45           No Bid 1.02           1.02           No Bid
0.30           0.30           No Bid 0.72           0.72           No Bid
0.25           0.25           No Bid 0.72           0.72           No Bid

15% No Bid 20% No Bid

2.25           2.25           No Bid 2.46           2.46           No Bid
15% No Bid 20% No Bid

No Bid No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid

No Bid No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid

No Bid No Bid 45.00         45.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

Phillips Lawn Sprinkler 
Company, Inc.

Pegasus Texas 
Construction

3D Mechanical Service 
Company, Inc.

Country Glass & Mirror, 
Inc.



CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
6. Plumbing

Master Plumber
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr

Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

7. Electrical
Master Electrician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

8. Overhead Door Repair
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

137.50       137.50       No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid
171.86       171.86       No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid
171.86       171.86       No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid

137.50       137.50       No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid
171.86       171.86       No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid
171.86       171.86       No Bid 100.00       100.00       No Bid

62.50         62.50         No Bid 45.00         45.00         No Bid
78.13         78.13         No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid
78.13         78.13         No Bid 70.00         70.00         No Bid

15% No Bid N/A No Bid

No Bid No Bid 99.00         99.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 148.50       148.50       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 198.00       198.00       No Bid

No Bid No Bid 75.00         75.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 112.50       112.50       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 150.00       150.00       No Bid

No Bid No Bid 40.00         40.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 60.00         60.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 80.00         80.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid

100.00       100.00       No Bid 150.00       150.00       No Bid
150.00       150.00       No Bid 220.00       220.00       No Bid
200.00       200.00       No Bid 220.00       220.00       No Bid

52.00         52.00         No Bid N/A No Bid
80.00         80.00         No Bid N/A No Bid

105.00       105.00       No Bid N/A No Bid
25% No Bid 17% No Bid

Phillips Lawn Sprinkler 
Company, Inc.

Pegasus Texas 
Construction

3D Mechanical Service 
Company, Inc.

Country Glass & Mirror, 
Inc.

2 man crew for safety



CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
9. Glass Replacement

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

10. Roofing
Composition Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft.
Tar and Gravel Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft.
Roof Coating
All inclusive surface preparation and coating 1 sq. ft.
Roof Repairs 1 hr
Installation of metal edging and wall flashing 1 Lft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

11. Building Automation Controls
Service Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Engineering and Programming
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

12. Irrigation
Irrigator
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Labor / Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

100.00       100.00       No Bid 45.00         45.00         95.00         95.00         
150.00       150.00       No Bid 65.00         65.00         130.00       130.00       
200.00       200.00       No Bid 65.00         65.00         180.00       180.00       

52.00         52.00         No Bid 30.00         30.00         60.00         60.00         
80.00         80.00         No Bid 45.00         45.00         90.00         90.00         

105.00       105.00       No Bid 45.00         45.00         120.00       120.00       
25% No Bid 20%

3.25           3.25           No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.75           8.75           No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.00           4.00           No Bid No Bid No Bid
140.00       140.00       No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.00           9.00           No Bid No Bid No Bid
15% No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 130.00       130.00       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 195.00       195.00       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 260.00       260.00       No Bid

No Bid No Bid 150.00       150.00       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 225.00       225.00       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 300.00       300.00       No Bid
No Bid No Bid 0% No Bid

40.00         40.00         64.00         64.00         70.00         70.00         No Bid
55.00         55.00         96.00         96.00         100.00       100.00       No Bid
80.00         80.00         128.00       128.00       100.00       100.00       No Bid

15.00         15.00         26.50         26.50         45.00         45.00         No Bid
20.00         20.00         39.75         39.75         70.00         70.00         No Bid
30.00         30.00         53.00         53.00         70.00         70.00         No Bid

15% 15% N/A No Bid

3D Mechanical Service 
Company, Inc.

Pegasus Texas 
Construction

Phillips Lawn Sprinkler 
Company, Inc.

included in labor

Country Glass & Mirror, 
Inc.
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
13. Water treatment of HVAC cooling towers 

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

14. Material Markup (%)
Includes all materials for all projects/jobs 1 pct

Vendors shall supply an explanation and list 
dollar amounts of other charges not included in 
above:  This includes trip charges and fuel 
surcharges.

Emergency Response Time following 
notification for all trades

Irrigation Emergency Repair response time
Golf Course - Same Day
Park Maintenance - 48 Hours

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid No Bid 30.00         30.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 45.00         45.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 45.00         45.00         No Bid
No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid

25% 34% 25% 45%

Yes Yes Yes N/A
Yes Yes Yes N/A

3D Mechanical Service 
Company, Inc.

Country Glass & Mirror, 
Inc.

1 hour minimum charge 
for all trades.  Bill in 1/2 
hour increments.  $50.00 
truck charge for all calls.

Measurement / 
Assessment Fee $45.00     
We do not have 24 hour 
emergency service

Pegasus Texas 
Construction

Phillips Lawn Sprinkler 
Company, Inc.

Plumbing $135.00 trip 
charge on emergency 
calls.  If area exceeds 25 
square feet - Tar & 
Gravel roof repairs 
minimum trip charge 
$4,500.00.  Roof coatings 
minimum set up charge 
$3,750.00.

Net 30

1 hour during normal 
business hours.  8 a.m. - 
5 p.m.

Awarded Bid Awarded Bid

1 hour2 hours - Plumbing.  4 
hours maximum Irrigation

Net 30Net 30 Net 30
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT

1.
General Carpenter, Drywall:  Tape and Bed, 

Texture, Painting, Wall Covering
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

2. Floor Tile
Commercial Grade VCT Installation 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft.
Rubber cove base installation per lineal foot 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

3. Carpet
Carpet tiles installed 1 sq. ft.
Roll carpet installed 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

4. Laminate Wood Flooring
Installation 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

5. Heating, Venting and Air Conditioning
Superintendant
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

77.50         77.50         110.83       110.83       No Bid 72.50         72.50         
116.25       116.25       166.25       166.25       No Bid 108.75       108.75       
116.25       116.25       221.66       221.66       No Bid 145.00       145.00       

77.50         77.50         70.53         70.53         No Bid 72.50         72.50         
105.75       105.75       105.80       105.80       No Bid 108.75       108.75       
105.75       105.75       141.06       141.06       No Bid 145.00       145.00       

48.50         48.50         45.64         45.64         No Bid 58.00         58.00         
72.75         72.75         68.46         68.46         No Bid 87.00         87.00         
72.75         72.75         91.28         91.28         No Bid 116.00       116.00       

N/A 25% No Bid No Bid

Denali Construction 
Services

DMI Corp (Decker 
Mechanical)

Facility Solutions Group Infinity Contractors 
International, Ltd.
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
6. Plumbing

Master Plumber
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr

Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

7. Electrical
Master Electrician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

8. Overhead Door Repair
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

77.50         77.50         110.83       110.83       No Bid 72.50         72.50         
116.25       116.25       166.25       166.25       No Bid 108.75       108.75       
116.25       116.25       221.66       221.66       No Bid 145.00       145.00       

70.50         70.50         70.53         70.53         No Bid 75.50         75.50         
105.75       105.75       105.80       105.80       No Bid 108.75       108.75       
105.75       105.75       141.06       141.06       No Bid 145.00       145.00       

48.50         48.50         45.64         45.64         No Bid 58.00         58.00         
72.75         72.75         68.46         68.46         No Bid 87.00         87.00         
72.75         72.75         91.28         91.28         No Bid 116.00       116.00       

N/A 25% No Bid No Bid

77.50         77.50         No Bid 72.00               72.00               No Bid
116.25       116.25       No Bid 108.00             108.00             No Bid
116.25       116.25       No Bid 108.00/144.00 108.00/144.00 No Bid

70.50         70.50         No Bid 65.00               65.00               No Bid
105.75       105.75       No Bid 97.50               97.50               No Bid
105.75       105.75       No Bid 97.50/130.00 97.50/130.00 No Bid

48.50         48.50         No Bid 32.00               32.00               No Bid
72.75         72.75         No Bid 48.00               48.00               No Bid
72.75         72.75         No Bid 48.00/64.00 48.00/64.00 No Bid

N/A No Bid N/A No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Denali Construction 
Services

DMI Corp (Decker 
Mechanical)

Facility Solutions Group Infinity Contractors 
International, Ltd.
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
9. Glass Replacement

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

10. Roofing
Composition Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft.
Tar and Gravel Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft.
Roof Coating
All inclusive surface preparation and coating 1 sq. ft.
Roof Repairs 1 hr
Installation of metal edging and wall flashing 1 Lft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

11. Building Automation Controls
Service Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Engineering and Programming
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

12. Irrigation
Irrigator
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Labor / Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

70.50         70.50         No Bid No Bid No Bid
105.75       105.75       No Bid No Bid No Bid
105.75       105.75       No Bid No Bid No Bid

48.50         48.50         No Bid No Bid No Bid
72.75         72.75         No Bid No Bid No Bid
72.75         72.75         No Bid No Bid No Bid

N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid

Denali Construction 
Services

DMI Corp (Decker 
Mechanical)

Facility Solutions Group Infinity Contractors 
International, Ltd.
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
13. Water treatment of HVAC cooling towers 

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

14. Material Markup (%)
Includes all materials for all projects/jobs 1 pct

Vendors shall supply an explanation and list 
dollar amounts of other charges not included in 
above:  This includes trip charges and fuel 
surcharges.

Emergency Response Time following 
notification for all trades

Irrigation Emergency Repair response time
Golf Course - Same Day
Park Maintenance - 48 Hours

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25% 30% 15% 25%

Yes N/A N/A N/A
Yes N/A N/A N/A

Denali Construction 
Services

DMI Corp (Decker 
Mechanical)

Trip charge $42.50 Trip charge $30.00 per 
invoice.  Equipment 
rentals as needed 
(furnished on truck).  
Sewer machine $35.00, 
Auger $10.00, Nitrogen 
$30.00, Recovery unit 
$100.00, Vacuum pump 
$70.00, Torch $45.00.  
Other equipment (as 
needed) include Hydro 
Jet $250.00, Plumbing 
camera $250.00.

Fuel Surcharge $10.00.  Tax 
(when applicable).

Trip charge $40.00

Facility Solutions Group Infinity Contractors 
International, Ltd.

Less than 2 hours 4 hours 2 hours or less 2 hours

5% 15 Days 1% 10 Days 3% 30 Days Net 30
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT

1.
General Carpenter, Drywall:  Tape and Bed, 

Texture, Painting, Wall Covering
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

2. Floor Tile
Commercial Grade VCT Installation 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft.
Rubber cove base installation per lineal foot 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

3. Carpet
Carpet tiles installed 1 sq. ft.
Roll carpet installed 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing tile 1 sq. ft.
Removal and disposal of existing carpet 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

4. Laminate Wood Flooring
Installation 1 sq. ft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

5. Heating, Venting and Air Conditioning
Superintendant
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

85.00         85.00         
127.50       127.50       
127.50       127.50       

75.00         75.00         
112.50       112.50       
112.50       112.50       

45.00         45.00         
67.50         67.50         
67.50         67.50         

15%

Innovation HVAC 
Services, LLC
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
6. Plumbing

Master Plumber
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr

Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

7. Electrical
Master Electrician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Journeyman
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

8. Overhead Door Repair
Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED

80.00         80.00         
120.00       120.00       
120.00       120.00       

70.00         70.00         
105.00       105.00       
105.00       105.00       

35.00         35.00         
52.50         52.50         
52.50         52.50         

15%

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Innovation HVAC 
Services, LLC
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
9. Glass Replacement

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

10. Roofing
Composition Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft.
Tar and Gravel Roofing
Removal, proper disposal and replacement 1 sq. ft.
Roof Coating
All inclusive surface preparation and coating 1 sq. ft.
Roof Repairs 1 hr
Installation of metal edging and wall flashing 1 Lft.
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

11. Building Automation Controls
Service Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Engineering and Programming
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

12. Irrigation
Irrigator
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Labor / Helper
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Innovation HVAC 
Services, LLC
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Bid Name:
Annual Facility Maintenance, Time and 
Material, Repair and Remodeling Contract

Bid Number: 2015-017
Date: January 13, 2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY UNIT
13. Water treatment of HVAC cooling towers 

Technician
Standard work week 1 hr
Overtime weekdays and Saturday 1 hr
Overtime Sunday and Holidays 1 hr
Subcontractor's Markup Cost (if applicable)

14. Material Markup (%)
Includes all materials for all projects/jobs 1 pct

Vendors shall supply an explanation and list 
dollar amounts of other charges not included in 
above:  This includes trip charges and fuel 
surcharges.

Emergency Response Time following 
notification for all trades

Irrigation Emergency Repair response time
Golf Course - Same Day
Park Maintenance - 48 Hours

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

   UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

N/A
N/A

Innovation HVAC 
Services, LLC

Additional charge - 
$35.00 trip charge per 
call

2 hours for both HVAC 
and Plumbing

1% 15 Days


	Awarded

