
CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Sandwiches & Breakfast Bars for Prisoners

Bid No. I137-2024

Date: January 4, 2024

Item No. Item Qty Unit Price Total

Type of 

Cheese Type of Meat Price Total

Type of 

Cheese

Type of 

Meat Price Total

Type of 

Cheese Type of Meat

I137-2024--01-01 Sandwiches 17,000 each 1.83 31,110.00     American Ground Beef 3.50 59,500.00     American Beef Patty No Bid

I137-2024--01-02 Breakfast Bars 9,996 each 0.43 4,298.28        No Bid No Bid

Minimum Dollar Amount Per Order 0.00 0.00 0.00

Gross Total: 35,408.28     59,500.00     

Less Discount:

Net Total: 35,408.28     59,500.00     

Terms:

Delivery:

Notes:

Sunbeam Foods, Inc.
Chisos Star LLC dba The Cook's 

Nook
Albie's Food Products, LLC

No Bid

2) $41.28/case  (96 count/case)  Strawberry, Apple 

Cinnamon and Blueberry

1) Each sandwich shall contain 2.5 oz. of a white roll 

type bread product 2 ounces of precooked ground 

beef patty and .40 ounces of American cheese.

1) $21.96/case  (12 Count/case)

2) Breakfast Bar flavors: Apple, Strawberry or 

Blueberry, 37 gram (1.3 ounces)


