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Bid Name: Annual Supply of Vehicle and Equipment Batteries
Bid Number: 2014-067
Date: April 17, 2014

Item Number Item Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total
Group 1 - Automotive Truck and Industrial Batteries

2014-067--01-01 Battery Type-58R 20 each 50.26 1,005.20 55.19 1,103.80 50.80 1,016.00
2014-067--01-02 Battery Type Gel Cell-SLA12350 25 each 51.00 1,275.00 50.89 1,272.25 No Bid
2014-067--01-03 Battery Optima-D31T 16 each 200.57 3,209.12 199.00 3,184.00 79.37 1,269.92
2014-067--01-04 Battery New Holland #F915DSW Type-EU456 8 each 89.08 712.64 85.80 686.40 No Bid
2014-067--01-05 Battery Type-34/78 150 each 59.59 8,938.50 60.05 9,007.50 63.21 9,481.50
2014-067--01-06 Battery Type-56CS 12 each 53.75 645.00 53.42 641.04 68.00 816.00
2014-067--01-07 Battery XHP31C Stud Post 230 each 75.63 17,394.90 72.97 16,783.10 75.38 17,337.40
2014-067--01-08 Battery Type-4DLT 10 each 108.68 1,086.80 94.11 941.10 98.25 982.50
2014-067--01-09 Battery Type-75 25 each 51.14 1,278.50 56.65 1,416.25 58.18 1,454.50
2014-067--01-10 Battery Type-8D 10 each 130.37 1,303.70 125.50 1,255.00 142.66 1,426.60
2014-067--01-11 Battery Type-U1L 12 each 27.92 335.04 29.99 359.88 38.54 462.48
2014-067--01-12 Battery Type-TM27 75 each 60.40 4,530.00 73.88 5,541.00 76.65 5,748.75
2014-067--01-13 Battery Type-TM24 50 each 43.69 2,184.50 68.49 3,424.50 50.63 2,531.50
2014-067--01-14 Battery Type-26-60 10 each 45.76 457.60 56.90 569.00 46.81 468.10
2014-067--01-15 Battery Type-4D 16 each 115.66 1,850.56 115.19 1,843.04 129.82 2,077.12
2014-067--01-16 Battery Group 49-93 16 each 93.55 1,496.80 85.80 1,372.80 91.00 1,456.00
2014-067--01-17 Battery Type-65 130 each 55.00 7,150.00 64.40 8,372.00 61.20 7,956.00
2014-067--01-18 Battery Type-26R 20 each 45.76 915.20 56.90 1,138.00 46.81 936.20
2014-067--01-19 Battery Type / Group 94R 200 each 91.21 18,242.00 79.57 15,914.00 105.92 21,184.00
2014-067--01-20 Battery Type / Group 48-91 35 each 60.79 2,127.65 73.33 2,566.55 78.69 2,754.15
2014-067--01-21 Battery Type / Group 47 10 each 69.60 696.00 79.92 799.20 68.62 686.20
2014-067--01-22 Battery Type / Group 34CS 16 each 57.00 912.00 62.10 993.60 53.39 854.24
2014-067--01-23 Battery Type / Group 55 Toro #104-9979 8 each 53.75 430.00 58.20 465.60 68.00 544.00

Total Group 1 $78,176.71 $79,649.61 $81,443.16

Metroplex Battery 
Distributors, LLC

Continental Battery 
Co. XL Parts

continued on page 2
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Bid Name: Annual Supply of Vehicle and Equipment Batteries
Bid Number: 2014-067
Date: April 17, 2014

Item Number Item Qty Unit
Group 2 - Discount

2014-067--02-01 Percentage discount 1 Percentage Off

Group 3 - Used Battery Credit
2014-067--03-01 Used Battery Credit 1 each

Item Response Form
Warranty

Signature Page

GROSS TOTAL: $78,176.71 $79,649.61 $81,443.16
LESS DISCOUNT: (1,563.53) (1,628.86)
NET TOTAL: $76,613.18 $79,649.61 $79,814.30
TERMS:
DELIVERY: 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day

Yes
Yes
Yes

5.00

Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

2% 10 Calendar Days Net 30 2% 10 Calendar Days

Metroplex Battery 
Distributors, LLC

Continental Battery 
Co. XL Parts

Yes
Yes

8.00 16.50

Total

2% 0%

Total

18.75%

Total
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Bid Name: Annual Supply of Vehicle and Equipment Batteries
Bid Number: 2014-067
Date: April 17, 2014

Item Number Item Qty Unit
Group 1 - Automotive Truck and Industrial Batteries

2014-067--01-01 Battery Type-58R 20 each
2014-067--01-02 Battery Type Gel Cell-SLA12350 25 each
2014-067--01-03 Battery Optima-D31T 16 each
2014-067--01-04 Battery New Holland #F915DSW Type-EU456 8 each
2014-067--01-05 Battery Type-34/78 150 each
2014-067--01-06 Battery Type-56CS 12 each
2014-067--01-07 Battery XHP31C Stud Post 230 each
2014-067--01-08 Battery Type-4DLT 10 each
2014-067--01-09 Battery Type-75 25 each
2014-067--01-10 Battery Type-8D 10 each
2014-067--01-11 Battery Type-U1L 12 each
2014-067--01-12 Battery Type-TM27 75 each
2014-067--01-13 Battery Type-TM24 50 each
2014-067--01-14 Battery Type-26-60 10 each
2014-067--01-15 Battery Type-4D 16 each
2014-067--01-16 Battery Group 49-93 16 each
2014-067--01-17 Battery Type-65 130 each
2014-067--01-18 Battery Type-26R 20 each
2014-067--01-19 Battery Type / Group 94R 200 each
2014-067--01-20 Battery Type / Group 48-91 35 each
2014-067--01-21 Battery Type / Group 47 10 each
2014-067--01-22 Battery Type / Group 34CS 16 each
2014-067--01-23 Battery Type / Group 55 Toro #104-9979 8 each

Total Group 1

Price Total Price Total Price Total

51.99 1,039.80 52.60 1,052.00 74.34 1,486.80
52.99 1,324.75 68.95 1,723.75 30.69 767.25

256.99 4,111.84 159.96 2,559.36 88.09 1,409.44
No Bid 66.50 532.00 No Bid

71.99 10,798.50 49.95 7,492.50 125.23 18,784.50
No Bid 61.95 743.40 74.93 899.16

71.99 16,557.70 46.50 10,695.00 88.09 20,260.70
108.99 1,089.90 89.95 899.50 117.54 1,175.40

53.99 1,349.75 51.08 1,277.00 66.84 1,671.00
137.99 1,379.90 112.85 1,128.50 156.71 1,567.10

31.99 383.88 41.95 503.40 36.42 437.04
71.99 5,399.25 79.95 5,996.25 73.60 5,520.00
55.99 2,799.50 69.95 3,497.50 68.85 3,442.50
46.99 469.90 48.20 482.00 62.97 629.70

123.99 1,983.84 99.93 1,598.88 132.94 2,127.04
94.99 1,519.84 170.18 2,722.88 94.77 1,516.32
61.99 8,058.70 59.95 7,793.50 74.45 9,678.50
42.99 859.80 48.20 964.00 62.97 1,259.40

116.99 23,398.00 159.47 31,894.00 128.95 25,790.00
82.99 2,904.65 146.05 5,111.75 90.65 3,172.75
68.99 689.90 79.95 799.50 83.34 833.40
60.99 975.84 72.95 1,167.20 74.81 1,196.96
59.99 479.92 49.25 394.00 74.93 599.44

$87,575.16 $91,027.87 $104,224.40

TKC Enterprises Inc. 
dba Batteries Plus

DT-DO Inc. dba IBS 
Dallas Napa Auto Parts

continued on page 4



City of Mesquite
Bid Tabulation

Page 4 of 6

Bid Name: Annual Supply of Vehicle and Equipment Batteries
Bid Number: 2014-067
Date: April 17, 2014

Item Number Item Qty Unit
Group 2 - Discount

2014-067--02-01 Percentage discount 1 Percentage Off

Group 3 - Used Battery Credit
2014-067--03-01 Used Battery Credit 1 each

Item Response Form
Warranty

Signature Page

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Price

$87,575.16 $91,027.87 $104,224.40

$87,575.16 $91,027.87 $104,224.40

7-10 Calendar Days 1 Calendar Day 3 Calendar Days
Net 30Net 30 Net 30

TKC Enterprises Inc. 
dba Batteries Plus

DT-DO Inc. dba IBS 
Dallas Napa Auto Parts

Yes
Yes

10% - Interstate
28% - Powervolt

Exchange only - one 
for one.  Extra cores 
at market value.

Total

20%

Total

Yes
Yes
Yes

9.00

No Bid

Yes Yes
Yes
Yes

0.00
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Bid Name: Annual Supply of Vehicle and Equipment Batteries
Bid Number: 2014-067
Date: April 17, 2014

Item Number Item Qty Unit
Group 1 - Automotive Truck and Industrial Batteries

2014-067--01-01 Battery Type-58R 20 each
2014-067--01-02 Battery Type Gel Cell-SLA12350 25 each
2014-067--01-03 Battery Optima-D31T 16 each
2014-067--01-04 Battery New Holland #F915DSW Type-EU456 8 each
2014-067--01-05 Battery Type-34/78 150 each
2014-067--01-06 Battery Type-56CS 12 each
2014-067--01-07 Battery XHP31C Stud Post 230 each
2014-067--01-08 Battery Type-4DLT 10 each
2014-067--01-09 Battery Type-75 25 each
2014-067--01-10 Battery Type-8D 10 each
2014-067--01-11 Battery Type-U1L 12 each
2014-067--01-12 Battery Type-TM27 75 each
2014-067--01-13 Battery Type-TM24 50 each
2014-067--01-14 Battery Type-26-60 10 each
2014-067--01-15 Battery Type-4D 16 each
2014-067--01-16 Battery Group 49-93 16 each
2014-067--01-17 Battery Type-65 130 each
2014-067--01-18 Battery Type-26R 20 each
2014-067--01-19 Battery Type / Group 94R 200 each
2014-067--01-20 Battery Type / Group 48-91 35 each
2014-067--01-21 Battery Type / Group 47 10 each
2014-067--01-22 Battery Type / Group 34CS 16 each
2014-067--01-23 Battery Type / Group 55 Toro #104-9979 8 each

Total Group 1

Price Total Price Total Price Total

80.57 1,611.40 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

200.63 3,210.08 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

106.65 15,997.50 No Bid No Bid
81.19 974.28 No Bid No Bid
94.99 21,847.70 No Bid No Bid

128.12 1,281.20 No Bid No Bid
73.61 1,840.25 No Bid No Bid

180.49 1,804.90 No Bid No Bid
46.92 563.04 No Bid No Bid
81.22 6,091.50 No Bid No Bid
76.71 3,835.50 No Bid No Bid
52.24 522.40 No Bid No Bid

149.11 2,385.76 No Bid No Bid
120.80 1,932.80 No Bid No Bid

89.39 11,620.70 No Bid No Bid
75.80 1,516.00 No Bid No Bid

132.60 26,520.00 No Bid No Bid
94.31 3,300.85 No Bid No Bid

120.11 1,201.10 No Bid No Bid
80.30 1,284.80 No Bid No Bid
79.73 637.84 No Bid No Bid

$109,979.60 No Bid No Bid

OReilly Auto Parts Napa Auto Parts Batteries Plus

continued on page 5
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Bid Name: Annual Supply of Vehicle and Equipment Batteries
Bid Number: 2014-067
Date: April 17, 2014

Item Number Item Qty Unit
Group 2 - Discount

2014-067--02-01 Percentage discount 1 Percentage Off

Group 3 - Used Battery Credit
2014-067--03-01 Used Battery Credit 1 each

Item Response Form
Warranty

Signature Page

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

$109,979.60 No Bid No Bid
(2,199.59)

$107,780.01 No Bid No Bid

1 Calendar Day
2% 10 Calendar Days

OReilly Auto Parts Napa Auto Parts Batteries Plus
Total Total

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

Total

Yes
No
Yes

15.00

41%
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