
ORDINANCE NO. 895 

.. -cvl ...cz&.-L-::=- 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER F I V E ,  ARTICLE TWO, 
S E C T I O N  5-6 O F  THE CODE OF T H E  CITY OF MESQUITE, 
TEXAS, BY AMENDING THE FOLLOWING SECTIONS O F  THE 
NATIONAL BUILDING CODE, TO W I T :  SECTION 6 0 2 . 2 ,  
SECTION 7 0 2 . 6 ,  SECTION 800.3. AND SECTION 8 0 2 . 1 :  
BY PROVIDING FOR TWO ( 2 )  E X I T  DOORS AT LEAST TEN 
(10) F E E T  APART FOR EVERY R E S I D E N T I A t  DWELLING 

U N I T ;  BY PROVIDING THAT EVERY MULTI-FAMILY DWELL- 
ING STRUCTURE HAVING MORE THAN ONE STORY SHALL 
PROVIDE NOT L E S S  THAN TWO ( 2 )  SEPARATE ROUTES TO 
T E E  OUTSIDE GROUND LEVEL WITH APPROVED STAIRWAYS; 
BY PROVIDING THAT EXTERIOR WALLS OF ALL MULTI- 
FAMILY RESIDENTIAL STRUCTURES SHALL BE OF SEVENTY 
F I V E  (75%) PER CENT MASONRY CONSTRUCTION BY SURFACE 
AREA: BY PROVIDING A METHOD O F  COMPUTATION OF SURFACE 
AREA AND DEFINING THE TERM "MULTI-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL 
STRUCTURE"; BY REDUCING THE MINIMUM THICKNESS O F  
F I R E  WALLS FRON TWELVE ( 1 2 )  INCi iES  TO EIGHT (8) 
INCHES AND PROVIDING THAT THE BUILDING INSPECTOR OR 
F I R E  MARSHAL MAY REQUIRE PROOF OF F I R E  RATING FROM 
A C E R T I F I E D  TESTING LABORATORY : BY PROVIDING MINI-  
MUM STANDARDS FOR ROOF COVERING: BY PROVIDING TO 
WHAT EXTENT THE: PROVISIONS OF T H I S  ORDINANCE SHALL 
CONTROL: BY PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE: BY 
PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY NOT T O  EXCEED TWO HUNDRED 
( $ 2 0 0 . 0 0 )  DOLLARS; AND BY DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. 

WHEREAS the C o d e  of t h e  C i t y  of Mesquite, T e x a s ,  and the N a t i o n a l  
B u i l d i n g  C o d e  a r e  i n a d e q u a t e  t o  a f ford  the  n e c e s s a r y  protection t o  
inhab i tan t s  of the  C i t y  f r o m  the haza rds  of f i re :  and 

WHEREAS it is d e e m e d  necessary to  amend  t h e  B u i l d i n g  C o d e  to 
afford  such protection: 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE I T  ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE C I T Y  OF . " 
MESQUITE, TEXAS : .$ 

? 

SECTION 1. T h a t  C h a p t e r  Five, A r t i c l e  Two, Section 5-6 o f  the  - 
C o d a  of the C i t y  o f  M e s q u i t e ,  T e x a s ,  is hereby a m e n d e d  as f o l l o w s :  

T h e r e  i s  added t o  t h e  above C h a p t e r ,  A r t i c l e  and Sect ion a f te r  sub- 
section (b) of Section 5-6 the t o l l o w i n g  n e w  sub-sections t o  read 
as f o l l o w s :  

( c )  S e c t i o n  6 0 2 . 2  a m e n d e d .  Section 6 0 2 . 2  o f  t h e  N a t i o n a l  
B u i l d i n g  C o d e  is hereby deleted and the following pro- 
v i s i o n s  are s u b s t i t u t e d  therefor: 

. . .  .... .- . . . .  .- . . . . . . . . . .  . . .  . -  --..--- 



ORDINANCE/PAGE 2 

I 
. . . . . . .  . . . . . . . .  ...................... 

Every r e s i d e n t i a l  dwelling u n i t  s h a l l  have not  l e a s  
than two (2) e x i t  doors separated by a t  l e a s t  t en  (10) ..... 
f e e t  of d i s t a n c e  between openings and such e x i t  doors 
s h a l l  each open onto an unobstructed way t o  the ou t s ide .  

Every mult i - family dwelling s t r u c t u r e  having more than 
one s t o r y  s h a l l  provide n o t l e s s t h a n  two ( 2 )  sepa ra t e rou te s  
to t h e  o u t s i d e  ground l e v e l  with approved stairways.  The 
same ba lcony or landing may be u t i l i z e d  provided t h a t  
s e p a r a t e  s ta i rways  a r e  provided a t  each end. 

This  s e c t i o n  s h a l l  apply on a l l  new s t r u c t u r e s  and e x i s t -  
i ng  s t r u c t u r e s  wherein s a i d  s t r u c t u r e  is damaged t o  t h e  
e x t e n t  t h a t  expendi ture  of f i f t y  (50%) per cent o f  t h e  
p r e s e n t  cost t o  rep lace  such s t r u c t u r e  i s  required t o  
r e p a i r  such damage and In such cases wherein major s t ruc -  
t u r a l  a l t e r a t i o n s  a r e  made. 

I (d) S e c t i o n  702.6 amended. Sect ion 702.6 of t h e  National * Bui ld ing  Code is amended by adding a  new sub-paragraph 
'-1 "e " a f t e r  sub-paragraph "d" containing t h e  folloGing 

p r o v i s i o n  : 

e. Without regard t o  any o ther  language herein, 
e x t e r i o r  w a l l s  o f  a l l  multi-family r e s i d e n t i a l  
s t r u c t u r e s ,  s h a l l  be  constructed o f  no t  l e s s  
t h a n  seventy-f ive (75%) per  cent  masonry con- 
s t r u c t i o n  by su r face  a rea .  - 
F o r  purposes of  t h i s  a r t i c l e  s u r f a c e  area o f  
e x t e r i o r  w a l l s  s h a l l  be computed as t o t a l  e x t e r i o r  
s u r f a c e  extending from t h e  ground t o  a point  e i g h t  
(8) f e e t  above t h e  f l o o r  leve l  of  t h e  uppermost 
f l o o r .  The term "multi-family r e s i d e n t i a l  s t r u c t u r e "  
s h a l l  mean s t r u c t u r e s  designed f o r  more than one 
occupancy u n i t ,  whether such u n i t  i s  designed f o r  
o n e  o r  more persons. 

- .  
I n  t h e  event  t h a t  any language i n  t h i s  Code o r  
o t h e x  City Ordinances may conflict .  wi th  the  pro- 
v i s i o n s  here in ,  t h e  provis ions of t h i s  a r t i c l e  
s h a l l  cont ro l .  

r : w ;  (el S e c t i o n  800.3 amended. Sec t ion  800.3 ~f t h e  National Build- ,,. 
., i n g  code  is  hereby amended so  a s  t o  change paragraph "a"  o f  ..... . . .  .... .: . . ,  

S e c t i o n  800.3 to read: .,, 



a. F i r e  wa l l s  of s o l i d  masonry s h a l l  be n o t  l e s s  
than e i g h t  k3) inches thick fo r  t h e  uppermost 
t h i r t y - f i v e  (35) f e e t  of t h e i r  height ,  and 
s h a l l  be  increased four (4) inches  i n  thick- 
ness  £or each successive t h i r t y - f i v e  (35) f e e t  
o r  f r a c t i o n  thereof  measured downward from t h e  
t o p  o f  t h e  wall  and sha l l  n o t  be pierced by 
s t r u c t u r a l  members, plumbing connections and 
piping,  e l e c t r i c a l  o r  communications wiring o r  
conduit,  a i r  conditioning o r  hea t ing  ducts ;  
provided, however, the Building Inspector o r  
F i r e  Marshal may require  proof o f  four (4)  hour 
f i r e  r a t l n g  a s  required i n  Sec t ion  800.2 by a 
c e r t i f i e d  t e s t i n g  laboratory.  

( f )  Section 802.1 amended. Section 802.2 of  tfie National 
Building Code is amended t o  provide: . 

802.2 Roof Covering ~ e q u i r e d  

a. Every roof placed on a bui lding or s t r u c t u r e  
i n  t he  C i ty  of  Mesquite s h a l l  be a Class A or 

3 Class B roof covering. C l s s s  C roo f s  a r e  no t  
allowed. 

b. 1. Asphalt Composition Roofs - 
To meet t h e  requirements he re in ,  asphal t  
composition roofing must have a minimum 
weight o f  230 pounds per 100 f e e t  square 
and s h a l l  be placed over a s o l i d  surface  
one-half ()'i) inch thick,  provided, however, 
three-eighths (3/8) inch t h ~ c k n e s s  s h a l l  be 

- s u f f i c i e n t  if on r a f t e r s  of no t  more than 
s ix t een  (16) inch cen te rs .  

2 ,  Asbestos Roofing - . ..- 

A minimum requirement f o r  asbestos  roofing 
s h a l l  be n o t  l e s s  than one-fourth (1/4) 
inch th ickn@ss  in s t a l l ed  over a one-half 
(1/2) inch thick so l id  sur face .  

- SECTION 2.  To t h e  ex t en t  any provis ion  of the  National BuiJ.ding 
9 Code o r  other  Ordinance may conf l i c t  w i t h  t h e  provisions herein, t h e  
- p r o v i s i o n s  contained l ierein s h a l l  con t ro l ;  i n  a l l  o the r  respects  t h e  

Code of t he  City of Mesquite, including such por t ions  of the ~ a t i a n a l  
Building Code heretogore adopted s h a l l  remain i n  f u l l  force and e f f e c t .  ! .. 



................ , 323 . . 

, ORDINANCE/PAGE 4 

SECTION 3. Should any word, phrase, sentence,  paragraph o r  sec- 
t i o n  of  t h i s  Ordinance be  held t o  b e  inval id  o r  unconst i tut ional ,  the  
remaining provis ions of t h i s  Ordinance s h a l l  remain in  f u l l  force and 
e f f e c t .  

SECTION 4. Any person, firm or corporat ion v io la t ing  any of 
t h e  provis ions of t h i s  Ordinance shall. be  deemed t o  be g u i l t y  of a 
misdemeanor and upon conviction in  the Corporation Court s h a l l  be 
s u b j e c t  t o  a f i n e  n o t  to exceed Two Hundred ($200.00) Dollars fo r  
each offense,  and each and every day such v i o l a t i o n  continues s h a l l  
c o n s t i t u t e  a separa te  offense. 

SECTION 5. The f a c t  t h a t  t h e  Code of t h e  Ci ty  Of Mesquite, Texas, 
and t h e  National Building Code a r e  inadequate to  afford the necessary 
p ro tec t ion  t o  t h e  inhabi tants  of t h e  City c o n s t i t u t e s  an urgency and 
an emergency for t h e  pqeservation of  the  pub l i c  hea l th ,  safety and 
wel fare  of  i ts c i t i z e n s  and requi res  t h a t  t h i s  Ordinance s h a l l  t ake  
e f f e c t  immediately from and a f t e r  i t s  passage and the  publ icat ion of 
t h e  capt ion of said Ordinance, as t h e  law i n  such cases provides. 

DUIY PASSED by the  City Council of t h e  C i t y  of Mesquite, Texas, 
on t h e  20th day of October .A .b . ,  1970. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

/ Norma G .  h c ~ a u g M  // Elland Archer 
Ci ty  Secre ta ry  " Ci ty  Attorney 


