ORDINANCE NO. 438

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MESQUITE, TEXAS, AMENDING

SECTION 107 OF THE 1955 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL BUILDING

CODE BY AMENDING SECTION l07.1 PROVIDING FOR THE APPOINT-
2 MENT OF A BOARD OF APPEAL; BY AMENDING SECTION 107.2 PRO-
! VIDING FOR THE TERM OF OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF APPEAL:; RY
AMENDING SECTION 107.3 PROVIDING FOR A QUORUM -OF THE BOARD
o : OF APPEAL; BY AMENDING SECTION 107.5 PROVIDING FOR THE PRO-
CEDURE OF THE BOARD OF APPEAL; BY AMENDING SECTION 107.6
PROVIDING FOR APPEALS TO THE BOARD OF APPEAL; BY AMENDING
SECTION 107.7 PROVIDING FOR MODIFICATIONS AND VARIATIONS BY
. THE BOARD OF APPEAL; BY AMENDING SECTION 107.8 PROVIDING POR
i DECISIONS OF THE BOARD OF APPEAL; AND BY AMENDING SECTION“
107.9 PROVIDING FOR APPEALS FROM DECISICNS OF THE BOARD OF
APPEAL; AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WSQUITE,
- TERAS: o

'-i..

Section 1, That Section 107.1 of the'j.sss- Edition of the |
Natiocnal Building Code. be, and the same is, hereby amended .go as

S | to read as follows.
- ] "107.1. Appointment- There is hereby created a Board of
¥ Appeal consisting of five (5) members who are qualified

by experience and training to pass upon matters pertaining

= to building construction and who shall be appointed by the

f_ﬂ City Manager with the advice and consent of the C:i.ty Council,”
1

Secti_on 2. 'I'hat Section 107.2 of the 1955 BEdition of the
National Building Code be, and the same is, hereby amended s0o as
to read as follows

Rl

»# "107.2 Term of Office: The members of the Boarg of Appeal
3 shall hold office f£rom the date of their appointment and
qualification until their successors have been appointed

] and gqualified. The appointwent or reappointment of members

3 of the Boaxd of Appeal shall be such that three (3) menbers

-4 shall be appointed on or about January 1 of odd-numbered

- . years, and two (2) menbexs. shall be appointed on or about — e
January 1 of even-numbered years. Any member of the Board

of Appeal may beyremoved by the Governing Body of the City
of Mesquite £0r cause. Vacangies within the Board shall be
£illed by appointment for the unexpired term."  Khbuniiy

Section 3. That Section 107.3 of the. 1955 Edition of the
National Building Code be, and the same s, . hereby amended g0 ag to
read ag follows:




Page 2
ordinance No. 438

A ks S au o g - el

"107.3 Quorum: Three (3) members of the Board of Appeal
shall constitute a quorum for the transaction of business
and action taken by the ¢quorum shall constitute an official
action of the Board., No member of the Board shall pass

sy upon any question in which he, or any corporation or firm
in whic¢h he is a sharecholdex, is interested."

fﬂ Section 4. That Section 107.5 of the 1955 Edition of the
“1 National Building Code be, and the same is, hereby amended so
as to read as £ollows:

"107.5 Procedure: The Board of Appeal shall select a
chairman of its own members and shall establish rules and
_I regulations for its own procedure not inconsistent with
o the provisions of this Code."
!

SBection 5. That Section 107.6 b of the 1955 Edition of the
National Building Code be, and the same is, hereby amended 80 as
to read as follows:

"107.6 b Appeals: An appeal shall be taken within thirvty
{(30) days from the date of the decigion appealed, by £iling
with the City Secretary three (3) written copiegs of the
s appeal. 2 certified check in the amount of ten ($10.00)
oy dollars payable to the City of Mesguite shall accompany
such appeal to cover the cost of processing such appeal.
The City Secretary shall retain one copy of such appeal
for the official records <of the City and shall refer two
{2) copies of the appeal to the Chief of the Division of

‘ Building Inspection, who shall investigate the facts and
il report the appeal and the facts to the Board of Appeal.”

l‘-_f_’ §oction 6. That Section 107.7 a of the 1955 Edition of the
- National Building Code be, and the same is, hereby amended so as
to read as follows:

o ——t— 07,7 a Modifications and Variations by the Board .0of Appeal:
a' The Board of Appeal, when so appealed to and after a public
' hearing, may vary the application of any provision of this
B Code to any particular case when, in its opinion, the en-
forcement thereof would do manifest injustice and would be
contrary to the spirit and purpose of this Code or public
interest, or when, in its opinion, the interpretation of
-3 the building official should.be nmodified or reversed. In
hearing such an appeal the Board of Appeal shall not have

the power to waive or set aside any of the requirements of
thisa Code.™ SLte dlly © 7

T T T P O N 1O P PR Tyt ity g rp b R T A T
P




L]

sy m%/f

- Clty Becretary

Page 3
Ordinance No. 438

Sy B I e T

EN T B [ o 4 T 11 8T < S E e R [ Tam s Sy g b - e o by

Section 7. That Section 107.8 a of the 1955 Edition of the
National Building Code be, and the same is, hereby amended so
az to read as follows:

"107.8 a Decisions of the Board of Appeal: The Board of
Appeal shall within thirty (30) days hear the appeal and
the facts and reach a decision. Every decision of the
Board shall be in writing and shall indicate the vote upon
the decision. BEvery decision shall be promptly filed with
the City Secretary and a certified copy of the decision
mailed to the appellant.”

Section 8. That Section 107.9 a and b of the 1955 BEdition
of the National Building Code be, and the same is, hereby amended
80 as to read as follows:

"107.9 a Appeals from Decisions of the Boayd of Appeal: A
person aggrieved by a decision of said Board of Appeal may,’
within thirty (30) days after £iling of the decision of the
Board in the office of the City Secretary, apply to the
appropriate Court of Law to annul or vacate the said order
of the Board of Appeal. Such suit shall be filed against
the Board of Appeal as defendant. The suit shall be tried
as other civil cases, the burden of proof devolving upon
the plaintiff assailing the order of the Board of Appeal.”
"107.9 b: In such suits the Board of Appeal shall be
defended by the City Attorney until f£inal determination

of the proceedings contained therein.”

Section 9., Whereas, the present provisions of the 1955 Edition
of the National Building Code adopted by the City of Mesquite
need O be amended insofar as certain provisions concerning the
Board of Appeal are concerned create an urgency and an emergency,
and in the preservation of the public health, safety and welfare
requires that this ordinance shall take effect immediately fxom
and after its passage as the law and charter in such cases provides.

DULY PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MESQUITE, TEXAS on =~

the 16th day of July, 1%62. )

N B. W. Cruce, Jr,/
Mayor

T SR B s

Norma G. McGaughy

IR N i LN
TR ST 1A 2 - T T L R L gy T £ PR ne s F it

e prri—te . ooy by R et e R TSNP TR RPN e
5 " - " T s L Dot % Ml & et b L
- R et R

¥
Ay

)
i
"t
]



